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Sleeping bags built like crazy. 
Okay. So we've gone bononos. We 

took our best selling sleeping bog and 
completely redesigned ii. Went all out. 
Now it hos everything. We're proud to soy 
it's Gerry-built. 

Lei's toke o look at it. 
Start with the 1.9 oz. ripslop nylon 

inside and ou1. Catch the Gerry-style 
lock-stitch seams. nine of 'em to the inch. 
Stitch on o #7 YKK Ziplon air-tight zipper 

that runs in any weather and corners like 
o Porsche. Then bury ii behind o down­
filled no-d raft tube We really bug 
ourselves with details. The Gerry-rigged 
special slant-box, contour baffled. three 
piece construction banishes cold spots 
forever. And the unique Gerry baffle 
collar keeps you up to your neck in 
warmth. Finally toke o lot of Gerry down 
and stuff it. A full 30 ounces of p rime 

Gerry / An Outdoors Sports Company 

goose. with 6" of uniform loft. lrs Gerry­
built-big ... large size garages o chassis 
up to 6'6;' yet weighs but 3 lbs.15 oz. 

It's Gerry-built-strong. so !hot it stays 
together through repeated washings 
and hard use. 

The redesigned Camper Mummy 
Bog. Still think ifs Gerry-built? Damn right. 
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NORMAN MYERS East Africa's 

Whither African Wildlife? 

DURING MY TRAVELS over the 
past few years in Europe and 
North America, I have gained 

the impression that the people there 
think that, of the three "Third World" 
continents, Africa is faring much bet­
ter than the other two as regards its 
wildlife. By extension, these people 
seem to assume that African wildlife 
is even doing all right. Well, by com­
parison with parts of Asia and much 
of central America, that is true. By 
comparison with what is needed to 
salvage even a tolerable remnant of 
wildlife in Africa by the end of the 

4 

century, present efforts are gro­
tesquely inadequate. 

If current trends continue, most of 
the great savannah spectacles of 
wildebeest, zebra, gazelle, impala, 
and the rest of the herbivores, plus 
their associated predators, which are 
the glory of Africa, could well disap­
pear outside parks and reserves with­
in another decade, if not by 1980. 
Most of the parks and reserves them­
selves will be fortunate to survive, as 
currently constituted, to 1990. By the 
year 2000, many if not most of the 
large mammal species of Africa, now 

frequently totaling as many as one 
million each, are likely to have been 
reduced to threatened status, if they 
have not been eliminated altogether. 

I should stress, at the outset, that the 
criticisms I advance are not to be 
taken as a condemnation of what Af­
ricans are attempting to do with their 
wildlife. On the contrary, the years 
since 1960, by which stage most 
countries of Africa had attained inde­
pendence, have shown an impressive 
record of achievement. Tanzania 
started on new nationhood with only 

Continued on page 9 



Vanishing Heritage IAIN ALLEN 

Mt. Kenya's Fading Wilderness 

SHORTLY BEFORE NOON on 
the thirteenth of September, 1899, 
a pair of Swiss guides by the 

names of Cesar Ollier and Joseph 
Brocherel, together with their client, 
an English geographer named Mac­
kinder, completed three hours of 
strenuous ice-cutting on the highest 
glacier of Africa' s second-largest 
mountain. One hour later, they stood 
on the summit, the first men to con­
quer Mt. Kenya. It was the culmina­
tion of a four-month expedition that 
had started from the port of Mar­
seilles, sailed to the East coast of 

Africa, traveled by rail to Nairobi, 
and had hiked from there through 120 
miles of jungle forest. They were the 
first, and for a time the last. The coun­
try was young. Farms were struggling 
and towns were growing. The rail­
way from the coast had just reached 
Nairobi. Engineers were trying to find 
a way of descending the line into the 
Great Rift Valley and architects 
strived to turn Nairobi from tin to 
stone. A colony was in the making. 
There was little time for mountain 
wandering. 

After the First World War, Kenya's 

settlers began to explore the moor­
lands and hidden valleys below the 
mountain, and a few ventured onto the 
lower cliffs of the twin summits, Ba­
tian and Nelion. Between the towns 
of Meru and Embu, eighty miles apart, 
a Scottish mission had been estab­
lished in the village of Chogoria, and 
a few ministers, no doubt seeking a 
substitute for their homeland high­
lands, had walked through the forests 
and found a world of undulating 
heather hills and idyllic meadows. 
Two laymen who developed a pro­
found love of the mountain were E.A. T. 

5 



"In the late afternoon, we reached 
Ernest Carr's Urtmumdi Httt. The 
place was refreshingly clean." 

Dutton and Ernest Carr. Rumor has 
it that Carr sliced a rough track clear 
through the forest to the moorlands 
and drove his Model-T Ford over it to 
a height of 12,000 feet. Perhaps. What 
we do know is that he built the Uru­
mandi Hut at 10,000 feet, a sturdy 
wooden house situated in a grassy 
glade just above the edge of the forest; 
it is still there today. 

Carr left us his track and the Uru­
mandi Hut; Dutton left us his delight­
ful book, Kenya Mountain ( 1926), 
which tells how it was in the days 
when one could have the entire moun­
tain to oneself, to roam across un­
known moorlands and discover their 
valleys and gorges alone, to flee the 
singularly depressing atmosphere of a 
Nairobi summer: "I suppose that to all 
of us the mere idea of escaping from 
our humdrum surroundings is happi­
ness itself; and in the highlands of 
Kenya the itch to escape is no less in­
sistent than in England. Moreover, in 
February there can be no better place 
to get away from than Nairobi .... In 
that month, when the streets are laden 
with dust and the heat is unhealthy 
and oppressive, a journey to the sep­
ulchered and malevolent heights of 
lstakar would be a charming and en­
joyable excursion." 

One wonders today whether Dutton 
would still find escape in the world of 
Mt. Kenya, or whether he would find 
it as malevolent now as the heights of 
Istakar. Today, there are twelve huts 
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on the mountain, and each year thou­
sands of visitors from overseas arrive 
to walk and climb on the peaks. Few 
of the walls and glaciers draping 
Batian and Nelion are unclimbed. 
There is little to discover high on Mt. 
Kenya and in the seasons of good 
weather there is no peace. The source 
of the problem is that of the seven 
routes of access t0 the peaks, Mackin­
der's 1899 trail is the shortest and 
easiest, and it is possible simply to 
walk to the third highest spot on the 
mountain, Point Lenana. The tourist 
can merely drive to the edge of the 
forest, hastily ascend the shortest val­
ley to the peaks, and trudge to the 
summit-praying along the way that 
he will not be too altitude-sick to 
press his camera shutter on the 16,3 5 5-
foot peak. He can then descend by the 
same trail to the village of Naro Moru 
in half a day. 

The results are not difficult to imag­
ine: increased pulmonary edema vic­
tims (there were more than twenty in 
1973), and unnecessary work for the 
National Park Mountain Rescue Team. 
A trail of garbage can now be followed 
all the way tO Top Hut at 15,700 feet. 
By the time the average tourist gains 
this height, he is deathly ill, and what 

happens to his waste is the last thing 
on his mind. The vicinity of Top Hut 
is a tragic mess. Fortunately, only this 
one trail is being marketed now by the 
tourist industry, and so far the other 
six trails are clean. Tourism is one of 
the mainstays of Kenya's economy, and 
the government is dedicated to mak­
ing the lives of its visitors as comfort­
able and convenient as possible. This 
includes access to Mt. Kenya, and to 
that end plans are now being discussed 
as to the possibility of a paved road to 
the 10,000-foot level on the Naro 
Moru route. This could then be linked 
on the moorlands to the Timau or 
Sirimon routes which ascend from the 
west. This would be no primitive, 
four-wheel-drive track, but a good all­
weather road capable of travel by 
nearly any automobile. After that, who 
knows? A self-service lodge has al­
ready been constructed at the head of 
the Naro Moru route. Why not an­
other higher on the moorlands, care­
fully placed on the future link road? 
Why hot in the valleys themselves? 
Why not build a cable-car telephe­
rique from the Teleki Valley to the 
mountain? 

The impact of tourism is not the 
only problem affecting the present 

"As we climbed higher we started seeing the giant grottndsels and 
lobelia. These plants can grow as high as fifteen feet 011 Mt. Kenya 
and in some areas there are whole forests of them." 



and probable future of Mt. Kenya. The 
country immediately surrounding the 
foothills is one of Kenya's richest 
agricultural areas. On the western 
side, vast farms spread over the land, 
and to the south and east, thousands 
of small native holdings checkerboard 
the landscape. In recent years, this 
agricultural empire bas been steadily 
edging up into the forests of the 
mountain. The trees h ave been cut and 
burned, and the land planted with 
corn, beans, and other subsistence 
crops. As the farms creep into their 
forests, the animals retaliate. Ele­
phants and buffalo trample the crops, 
leopards strike at goats and cattle.The 
game department is called in and the 
animals are destroyed. As the animals 
cease to be a threat, the farmers be­
come more confident and push deeper 
into the forest. T he animals again 
react. The game department is called, 
and the cycle of killing continues. 
Finally, oo the northern side of Mt. 
Kenya a great lumber industry has de­
veloped. Many small African com­
panies have formed and the search for 
timber has begun. They do not have 
to look far, and low down on the Cho­
goria Route one can see a wrecked and 
littered forest and stacks of freshly cut 
lumber on either side of the trail, ready 
for shipment. 

I am a mountain guide by profes­
sion, and I have come to love Kenya 
as Carr and Dutton once loved it. For 
years I have wanted to give overseas 
conservationists a chance to see this 
mountain as it should be seen, while 
it can still be seen, as it might have 
been seen 75 years ago. To take them 
up a seldom-traveled trail to the sum­
mit and bring them back down to 
Naro Moru. A complete traverse of 
the mountain. An immediate compari­
son. An opportunity for the mountain 
to show someone what it really is. 

I got my chance in 1973, when a 
Sierra Club group arrived in Kenya for 
a tour of the country and an ascent of 
Point Lenana. I told them w hat I 
wanted to do, and they agreed eagerly. 
I would guide our party of eighteen­
eight Sierra Club members, nine por­
ters, and myself-up the mountain 
from the east, following Carr's orig­
inal trail from Chogoria, neglected for 
many years, then descend the other 
side to Naro Moru village. We would 
ascend the path of the pioneers and 
descend the way of the thousands. To 
find Mt. Kenya in its original state, we 
would go back to where it began. 

" Ill the highest places sheer rock and ice cliffs grace a summit which only a tech-
11icia11 could reach. It is au ,mp,·edictable world . .. " 

Mt. Kenya has three worlds. Each 
one is distinct, holds its own atmo­
sphere and has a character which no 
other shares. In the highest places 
sheer rock and ice cliffs grace a sum­
mit which only the technician can 
reach. It is an unpredictable world, 
w h ere the experienced find accep­
tance and the ignorant fear. Like a 
giant carpet the moorlands unfold be­
low this relatively hostile environ­
ment. Theirs is a silent world, dented 
by fine valleys and rugged gorges. An 
everchaoging land. In the warmth of 
the sun it welcomes, but within sec­
onds it can be transposed into one of 
foreboding gloom. The walker is al­
ways a visitor; it matters little how 
often he goes there. Below the moor­
lands is a third world. The unexplored 
land of the leopard, buffalo and ele­
phant. The forest. 

The rain falls heaviest on the eastern 
forests of Mt. Kenya and here it is at 
its thickest. It is a great conglomer­
ation of camphor, cedar, podocarpus 
and the East African olive. Within an 
hour of leaving Chogoria we found 
ourselves in its depths. Little of it is at 
peace. The chattering of the colobus 
monkey and the song of the ruraco 
bird; the rustling of some hidden ani­
mal, or the distant trumpeting ele­
phant and grating leopard. Few men 
have been here and the live things in 
the forest have nothing to fear. To 

walk more than a hundred yards from 
the trail, one is likely to be on ground 
untrodden by human feet. 

Between the forest region and the 
alpine moorlands is the bamboo belt. 
Owing to the heavy rainfall, the bam­
boo in this area bas grown to abnor­
mal heights. Our trail was only two 
or three feet wide and the bamboo 
grew to over forty feet on either side. 
It is dense, impenetrable and at times 
parts had been smashed aside by large 
animals. For the most part it was like 
walking through a large tunnel. After 
leaving the bamboo, for the next swo 
hours we hiked through an area of 
giant heath and our trail crossed some 
of the many sparkling streams w hich 
snake down from the glaciers high on 
the mountain. In the late afternoon we 
reached Ernest Carr's Urumandi Hut. 
The place was refreshingly clean. As 
darkness closed in, the temperature 
dropped and we made a fire. 

Rising was with the dawn (most of 
a day's walking is done in the morn­
ing, as the afternoon is usually sub­
jected to a thick cloud cover). Shortly 
after leaving the hut, we walked into 
ao area of burnt grass and charred 
heather. This had been caused by na­
tive honey gatherers, and they present 
another problem on Mt. Kenya. They 
belong to a wandering tribe called the 
Ndorobo, who search the moorlands 
for bee hives and occasionally set up 
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artificial hives to attract the bees. When 
the gatherers find a hive, they set fire 
to banana leaves and smoke the bees 
out of the vicinity. Often their work 
ends up setting the mountain on fire. 
On this particular occasion they set 
fire to over a hundred square miles of 
moorland. Usually the worst burnings 
take place toward the end of a drought, 
but when the rains arrive the land is 
back to normal within six months. 

As we climbed higher we started 
seeing the giant groundsels and lo­
belia. These plants can grow as high 
as fifteen feet on Mt. Kenya and in 
some areas there are whole forests of 
them. On reaching the 12,000-foot 
elevation we came upon one of the 
finest views on the mountain: the 
Gorges Valley, named after Captain 
Gorges, a colonial administrator who 
assisted Mackinder's expedition. The 
valley falls sheer on both sides for 
nearly two thousand feet. Far below 
and flowing steeply down the floor of 
the valley is the Nithi River, and sev­
eral miles further up we could see the 
Nithi Falls pounding over one of the 
rock steps for almost three hundred 
feet. Much of the Gorges Valley is un­
explored and it is a commanding spec­
tacle. Our trail ascended the western 
ridge of the valley and for the next 
three hours we were able to study its 
grandeur in detail. 

Toward the end of the day's walk, 
some of the party began to tire, but we 
were gradually gaining height and 
this was to be expected. We were mak­
ing for Hall Tarns which is at the head 
of the Gorges Valley, high up on top 
of the western ridge, at an altitude of 

" We camped by the side of a lake at Hall Tarns." 

just over 14,000 feet. A word about 
Hall Taros. It would be wrong to 
dismiss it simply as the gateway to the 
peak area of Mt. Kenya. It is the bor­
der of the higher and lower places, 
and the character of both. The Hall 
Tarns are a collection of small lakes 
poised on the summit of The Temple 
- a 1,000-foot rock buttress over­
hanging the waters of Lake Michael­
son which shimmers far below on the 
floor of the Gorges Valley. The Tem­
ple is the guardian of eastern Mt. 
Kenya and perhaps the source of its 
mysteries. Surrounding Hall Tarns 
are the scarred rusty peaks of Dela­
mere, Coryndon and Macmillan­
challenging yet neglected. Challeng­
ing for the climbing possibilities they 
offer; neglected, for they are fortunate 
enough to stand far from the fre­
quented trails. We camped by the side 
of a lake at Hall Tarns, and some slept 
in the small hut. We had time to see 
the late afternoon cloud swirling be­
low The Temple, and finally lifting in 
the orange rays of a dying sun. 

On the beginning of our third day 
on Mt. Kenya, our objective was the 
Top Hut, and the joining of the nor­
mal tourist route. I think some in the 
party were sorry to leave Hall Tarns, 
and many agreed that an extra day 
would have been worth while. The 
trail now led into a changing land­
scape. Gone were the groundsels and 
lobelias, and in their p lace stood the 
stark lichen-covered rocks and boul­
ders. Glacier-scoured cliffs loomed 
above us and fractured screes lay 
ahead. Our trail contoured the worst 
of the screes but the combination of 

scree and 15,000 feet does not lead to 
easy hiking. We were half an hour's 
walk from Top Hut when we joined 
the trail which leads round the upper 
peak area of Mt. Kenya. A few hun­
dred feet below us lay the broken re­
mains of three horses- a grim re­
minder of who suffers at altitude when 
the walker has no intention of walk­
ing. \Ve reached Top Hut at noon. 

Our journey was nearly o ver. For 
three days we had walked over a fine, 
almost unknown country, covering a 
distance of more than 30 miles. We 
were now 15,700 feet above sea level, 
situated on the eastern side of the 
Lewis Glacier, almost astride the equa­
tor. A short distance above us stood 
Point Lenana at the highest part of the 
Lewis Glacier, and across the screes 
and snow, the walls of Nelion and 
Batian rose vertically for 2,000 feet. 

In the afternoon we traversed the 
glacier and scrambled to the summit 
of Point Melhuish. This 16,000-foot 
peak stands directly below the twin 
summits of Batian and N elion, and the 
views are spectacular. We could see 
the plains of Naro Moru and the sun 
glinting on the Kikuyu huts far below. 
In the distance the Aberdare mountain 
range reminded us of just how high 
we were. A cold night was spent in 
Top Hut, and in the early morning we 
climbed up the frozen ice ridge to the 
summit of Point Lenana. On the 
southern horizon the snow dome of 
Kilimanjaro could be seen more than 
two hundred miles away. 

It was time to go. Slowly, and I 
think reluctantly, our party descended 
the southwestern side of the mountain 
and dropped into the Teleki Valley, 
over the well-worn tourist trail, past 
the strings of garbage and cans and 

Ji detritus. I had shown them the moun­
~ tain I loved, and now they were seeing 
.i; what too much love- or at least curi­-!! 

osity- could bring to a high, wild 
place like Kenya. We passed many 
groups of walkers who were ascend­
ing from this side, gasping, tired, dis­
couraged. We attempted tO answer 
their questions- how far is it now to 
the head of the valley, how difficult is 
the final stage to the top of Lenana? 
Not far, we said, but the last stage is 
but a small part of the whole journey. 
Our answer was met with looks of dis­
may. Remembering what we bad seen 
in our three days and realizing how 
little they were seeing in their difficult 
two, we could almost laugh at them. 
Almost. • 



WILDLIFE (Cont. from page 4) 

one national park. Now it has nine, 
with others on the drawing board. 
Tanzania spends a greater share of its 
national budget-approximately as 
much as Los Angeles spends on ice­
cream each year-on safeguarding its 
wildlife than does the U.S.A. on its 
bison, Yosemite, and other wildland 
spectacles. To be sure, Tanzania has 
more wildlife left to protect; but Tan­
zania ranks among the dozen most 
impoverished nations on earth. 

Zambia similarly started indepen­
dence with only a handful of protected 
areas, but now one-third of the coun­
try-90,000 square miles, or an area 
almost the size of Oregon-has re­
ceived conservation status. Zaire has 
come through 15 years of tumult with 
ideals intact enough to have classified 
already five percent of its territory as 
national parks, and seeks to reach 13 
percent within a few years. The great 
parks of eastern and southern Africa 
-Serengeti, Amboseli, Tsavo, Luang­
wa Valley, Kafue, Wankie, Kruger, 
Kalahari Gemsbok, Etosha, Goron­
goza, total almost 200,000 square 
miles, an area greater than California. 
Moreover, a mere handful of species 
and subspecies have become extinct 
in Africa during recorded times, and 
fewer are listed as endangered than 
in any other continent. 

The track record to date is impres­
sive by virtually any criterion. The 
point is, will these strategies work so 
successfully in the future? 

The future will be a different scene, 
that's for sure. The growth rate of the 
human population in the countries 
with greatest wildlife spectacles is 

Wildebeest at the watering hole 

Norma,, Myers 

Dnring migration, a wildebeest herd may darken the plains/or miles. 

around 3. 5 percent, the highest aver­
age in the world for an extended re­
gion. More significant still, the age 
distribution-more than 50 percent 
in the category 15 years old or less­
means that this "young population," 
to use the demographic term, will 
keep on expanding for many decades 
to come: the parents of the future have 
already been born. To date, the aver­
age family size totals between six and 
seven children and, as nutritional lev­
els rise in the segment of females at 
reproductive age, the number of chil­
dren per family is going up (pioneer 
America, when going through its 
phase as a developing country, aver­
aged seven children per family­
though with a far lower survival rate 
than contemporary Africa). 

Kenya, for instance, the first coun­
try of black Africa to institute family 
planning as an official program in 
1967 (it took guts to do that), had a 
fertility rate at that time of 6. 7 chil­
dren; by now it is around 7.4, and is 
expected to go above 8 before it can 
be turned downward. The Population 
Council from New York came to 
Kenya a few years back at the invita­
tion of the Kenya government, and 
concluded that if financial resources 
for birth control were to be increased 
ten times, there would be a time lag 

of ten years before the population 
growth rate could be turned around. 
Even were black-Africa countries to 
do overnight what it has taken North 
America and Europe over one cen­
tury co achieve-viz., reduce family 
size to replacement rates-the popu­
lace would increase between two and 
three times before it approaches zero 
population growth. 

But, some would say, Africa is still 
the last great empty continent. Well, 
not any more it ain't. Those people 
who divide Africa's population total 
of 3 5 5 million into the amount of land 
should try to live off subsistence crops 
in Nevada. Only ten percent of Africa 
is now suitable for cultivation, due 
largely to poor rainfall. The arable 
areas are already full to capacity. The 
wildlife addict who flies into Nairobi 
and then dashes off to the distant 
game parks should take a trip ten 
miles north into Kikuyuland. There 
he would see people trying to make a 
living off the land at densities of 
1,600 to a square mile, or half as much 
land as the peasant in comparatively 
spacious ·1ndia enjoys. 

A similar situation obtains for the 
Buganda, the Luo, and other tribes 
around Lake Victoria in Uganda and 
Tanzania, as well as in Kenya. On the 
slopes of Kilimanjaro, the Chagga 

9 



Elephants and cattle egrets 

likewise try to scratch a living through 
horticulture rather than agriculture, 
at densities comparable to rural Hol­
land and J apan. They would not pack 
in so tightly if there were suitable 
areas elsewhere. One marginally ap­
propriate place to which excess peo­
ple migrate is the big city. T he safar­
ist to Nairobi could obtain an even 
more vivid impression of the popula­
tion-resources-environment crunch in 
Kenya if he came back to Nairobi 
from Kikuyuland via the city suburbs 
where, in one locality, he would see a 
single-story shantytown of people as 
crowded as 1,000 to an acre (how do 
they all find space to sleep at once?). 

When people are reduced to living 
in conditions of this sort, they readily 
try out any opportunity for land avail­
ability, however marginal. A signifi­
cant consequence is the over-spill 
from fertile areas into the biotopes 
which seem to offer a prospect for hu­
man settlement, viz., the savannah 
zones. If a farming community wishes 
to colonize new territory, the people 

Grant's zebra Elephants 

are little inclined to head for thorn 
bush or scrub country or tsetse-ridden 
woodlands; rather they head for the 
grasslands. If these grasslands are the 
haunt of enormous throngs of plains 
game, as in Masailand of southern 
Kenya and northern Tanzania, then 
too bad. If some of those herbivore 
herds form part of wildlife communi­
ties which are centered o n, but by no 
means confined tO, protected areas 
such as Serengeti, Tarangire, and Nai­
robi Parks, then hard luck on the peo­
ple who alone seem to derive benefit 
from the protected areas; i.e., the af­
fluent foreigner. If it should be a 
white foreigner, the African can 
hardly be blamed if his thinking be­
comes colored (so to speak). 

A measure of things to come is to be 
noted in parts of eastern Kenya where 
the human population has reputedly 
been increasing at rates between 10 
and 35 percent per year. One con­
sequence of this migratory surge has 
been to increase pressure on Tsavo 
Park's hinterlands, the 9,000 square 

miles of support zone that contain 
some of the elephant populations lo­
cated in and around the 8,000-square­
mile park: more elephants seek sanc­
tuary in the park, more vegetation is 
over-used, more carcasses make the 
next mini-drought seem a catastrophe, 
and so forth. 

Not that this over-spill from the 
arable areas would necessarily mean 
that all of, say, Kenya would be over­
run. Cultivation is generally a poor 
bet where the rainfall average is less 
than 30 inches per year. That has 
meant that hitherto at least four-fifths 
of K enya has been safe from the dig­
ging hoe. But desperate people are 
now ready to try their luck in areas 
with as little as 20 inches of rainfall 
-which means in the grasslands with 
their exceptional wildlife congrega­
tions. 

Those parks and reserves which are 
located in arid territories with rainfall 
below 20 inches per year seemed until 
recently to be secure. But the last few 
years have seen the development of 
drought-resistant strains of maize, 
genetic variations able to reach ma­
turity with only 5 to 7 inch es of rain 
per season. This means that the great 
proportion of wildlife country in 
Kenya is now available for cultivation 
and colonization. 

The process will be slow at first 
(and thus-to repeat the point- per­
mit scope for adaptation of conserva­
tion strategies). But Kenya's rural 
population of 13 million people is al­
ready exerting unsupportable pres­
sures on the major wildlife ecosys­
tems. By the end of the century, even 
with extensive family-planning cam­
paigns and with intensified agriculture 
through green revolutions, there will 
be at least another 13 million people 
with no land in their ancestral re­
serves and with no employment pros­
pects in the urban conglomerations 
that will then pass for cities. There­
fore, these people will look for any 
patch of country on which to plant 
subsistence crops-woe t0 wildlife if 

Cheetah 



that is wildebeest, or zebra, or gazelle 
habitat. K enya's experience is paral­
leled by similar situations in Zambia, 
Ethiopia, Mozambique, Angola, and 
Tanzania. Rhodesia, South Africa, and 
Namibia are already developed to the 
point where wildlife is reduced to 
token communities in isolated parks 
and reserves. 

The Cheetah's Plight 

The cheetah sums up many of these 
pressures. Africa now totals less than 
25,000 cheetah, possibly fewer than 
10,000. Whatever the true figure may 
be, a more significant calculation is 
that the total is almost certainly only 
half what it was in 1960; and, unless 
current trends are changed, present 
nu,:nbers will drop to half today's to­
tal within another ten years, perhaps 
by 1980. This is because the cheetah, 
largely confined to savannah grass­
lands, encounters progressive disrup­
tion of its life-support systems from 
newly established cultivator commun­
ities. Where the cheetah can still find 
uncultivated grasslands, it encounters 
another, equally bad threat. 

Stockmen in Africa, whether estab­
lished ranchers such as those in 

Photos by Norman J\l)'ers 

Kenya, Zambia, and southern Africa, 
or subsistence pastoralists trying to 
undertake commercial practices, such 
as the Masai of East Africa and the 
Herero of Namibia, or the drought­
stricken Tuareg nomads of the Sa­
hara fringe, do not wish to hear of 
wild predators any longer. Nor do 
they wish to hear of wild herbivores, 
for that matter. Every Stockman now 
has increasing incentive to make sure 
the grass goes down the throats of his 
domestic herds, not into gazelles and 
other wild herbivores which form the 
cheetah's main prey. 

When natural prey runs short, the 
cheetah turns to sheep and calves and 
goats. This occurs at a time when the 
Stockman is trying to make his oper­
ations both more extensive and inten­
sive for a variety of reasons, among 
which a principal factor is the need to 
relieve the world beef famine. In a 
time of narrowing profit margins, the 
rancher eliminates every source of 
loss. Whereas in the past he had been 
prepared to remain ignorant, or at any 
rate to ignore, such occasional losses 
as could be blamed on wild predators, 
he now keeps an eye on what happens 
to every last animal in his holdings. 
Of the predators responsible-lions, 
leopards, hyenas, wild dogs and chee­
tah-the cheetah accounts for fewest 
instances (except possibly the wild 
dog). But, because the cheetah hunts 

during the day, and by an extended 
chase rather than ambush at close 
quarters, it draws attention to itself 
and is thus easier to dispatch. 

New Conservation Strategies 

What is to be done about this situa­
tion, for parks and declining species 
alike? A range of options is available, 
partly to shore up existing measures 
and partly to explore new opportuni­
ties. The policy of outright protection 
for parks has served well enough to 
date. But, given the pressures which 
are to be increasingly exerted on these 
large tracts of land locked away for 
apparently "useless" purposes (at 
least as the African perceives the sit­
uation, and he is the man whose per­
ception counts ), they may not survive 
the incoming tide unless they can bet­
ter accord with the legitimate needs 
of emergent Africa. 

It would be deplorable, of course, 
were the great parks to disappear. But 
when a man and his family starve for 
want of a cash-income equivalent to 
what a can't-make-ends-meet Ameri­
can spends on martinis each year, 
there is little doubt which party's sur­
vival prospects are poor and which 
are worse. 

If wildlife lands just outside the 
boundaries of established preserves 
were given over to sustained-yield ex­
ploitation of the wildlife resource, the 

Cheetahs are now regarded as dangerous pests by 11ative stockmen. 
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parks themselves might mean more, 
in terms of aspirations for Africa, not 
only to the American preservationist 
but also the African peasant. The 
Serengeti migration, for example, 
could produce perhaps 40 million 
tins of canoed meat each year without 
any decline in total wildebeest, zebra 
and gazelle numbers below the pres­
ent two million. There would be no 
need for any cropping to take place inside 
the park boundaries. There need be no 
undue disturbance to the herds that 
make up the tourist attraction. But 
this initiative would depend primarily 
upon shifting public opinion, which, 
in councils outside Africa, tends to 

insist that African wildlife should not 
be tainted with commercial consider­
ations. 

A major United Nations game-crop­
ping experiment in Kenya, with po­
tential for safeguarding park popula­
tions, has just been brought to a halt, 
in part as a response to anti-exploita• 
tion opinion outside Africa. The same 
occurred a few years back in the 
Luangwa Valley in Zambia, with its 
huge, if not excessive numbers of ele­
phant, hippos and buffalo-all ani­
mals which produce a pile of high­
quality protein for a single bullet. In 
Kenya's Tsavo Park in the last few 
years, at least 7,000 elephants have 
died of starvation, meaning 15 to 20 
thousand pounds of meat left to the 
vultures, at a time when one quarter 
of a million people in Kenya received 
famine relief food (much of it by 
courtesy of the generous folk in the 
United States). 

A further conservation strategy 
could lie in exploitation of animals 
far away from protected areas. The 
image of predators in general could 
be enhanced to the extent that ranch­
ers are less l ikely to exterminate chee­
tah, lions, and the rest, if the leopard 
were allowed to sell its skin on the 
open market. A two-year survey which 
I conducted on behalf of the Inter­
national Union for the Conservation 
of Nature and the World Wildlife 
Fund reveals that Africa contains at 
least 100,000 leopard, perhaps many 
more. An off-take of 10,000 sk ins per 
year could be easily sustained by this 
total. 

If the trade were strictly regulated, 
and the profits more equitably distrib­
uted, the African Stockman would de­
rive benefit from the creature which 
he at present looks upon with the 
same spirit as the American rancher 
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views the coyote and the cougar. A 
sufficiently controlled trade might be 
difficult to organize, but human inge­
nuity has managed to surmount the 
difficulties with diamonds, so why not 
spotted furs? Ao initiative along these 
lines would, of course, mean a basic 
adjustment in conservationist atti­
tudes in North America and Europe, 
where the cry for the past ten years 
has been that all spotted cats are being 
driven to the brink by the interna­
tional fur trade. That argument still 
holds good for pretty well all spotted 
cats except the leopard in Africa. Can 
would-be protectors of African wild­
life prove sufficiently adaptable in 
their attitudes to support rather than 
resist such radical reorientation of 
strategy? 

A similar situation afflicts the zebra. 
Competing as it does for rangeland 
with domestic livestock, the zebra is 
being steadily squeezed out of its habi­
tat-unless it can prove itself as effi­
cient in the marketplace as cattle. The 
zebra is quite capable of proving a 
match, since its meat covers the cost 
of cropping operations, and an aver­
age skin sells in Abercrombie and 
Fitch for $300. But preservationist 
sentiment has bar red the market to 
zebra skins in th e states of California 
and New York, the two largest mar­
kets on earth for this product. 

Common Heritage of Mankind 

A further innovation could lie in the 
"common property resource" con­
cept. If African wildlife is reckoned 
to be an asset not only of Africa but of 
mankind in general, both now and in 
the future, what can mankind do about 
its protection? Supposing the wildlife 
congregations at stake could be desig­
nated as a resource in which society 
at large has a legitimate interest, the 
way could be open for society to show 
how much financial clout goes with its 
conservationist convictions. In other 
words, the world community would 
somehow have to channel a cash sub­
vention to the African countries in 
question year by year, in order to 
compensate their citizens for the 
"opportunity costs' ' they experience 
in not putting the wHd!ands to "more 
appropriate" purposes. This would 
constitute a quantum Jeap in interna­
tional relations. In scores of senses it 
would run counter to the prevailing 
spirit of international relations, where 
interdependency is a fact which few 
people wish to face up to. 

Society has bad little experience in 
looking after society's property. Most 
societal institutions, whether eco­
nomic, legal, cultural or political, are 
geared to the id ea of private property 
rather than common property. Ao 
initiative of th e type suggested h ere 
would mean a departure from the pat­
tern of affairs since man first gathered 
into sizable communities 5,000 years 
ago. But perhaps the alternatives make 
a giant stride of this sort a little easier 
to contemplate. 

Despite the still-rising interest io 
Africa's wildlife, present efforts at pro­
tection have less and less effect on the 
ground. Furthermore, perhaps the 
idea of cash assistance could be more 
readily stomached if Americans were 
to consider that they should not make 
the gesture out of charity. Rather they 
should seek to compensate for "ex­
ternality effects," such as cheetah kill­
ing, in the beef-producing grasslands 
of Africa. The environmentally in­
clined citizen of North America is not 
only a conservationist, he is likewise 
a consummate consumer, with the 
consequence that what he achieves for 
wildlife with his right hand is often 
undermined by his half-dozen left 
hands. We are all in the same boat; so 
whose end is sinking? • 

Norman .Mye,·s is a distin­
guished authority on African 
wildlife. Author of The Long 
African Day, he now serves as 
Regionctl Wildlife Officer for 
Africa 11nder the United Na­
tions Food and Agricultural 
Organization, based in Accra, 
Ghana. He has been a consult­
ant to several international 
scientific and environmental 
organizations. The opinions ex­
pressed in this article are those 
of D r . .Myers and do not neces­
sarily represent the position of 
the Sierra Club or its individ­
ual members. We will continue 
to present articles that reflect 
the views of important spokes­
men in the environmental com­
munity on issues of special in­
terest to our readership. We 
welcome ;1011r response. 



1976 
FOREIGN 
OUTINGS 

Formerly remote and inaccessible areas of the world 
have now been brought within the reach of almost 
anyone with a few weeks vacation and a thousand 
dollars or so. Again in 1976, the Sierra Club will 
offer more than a thousand members, sub-teens to 
seventies, never to be forgotten visits to those faraway 
places .. . journeys to Greenland's icy shore, to 
warm Mexican beaches, to the islands of the sea and 
to the reefs thereunder, to Africa, to Asia and to 
Europe. Read on, and start to dream. 

(425) Tasmania and New Zealand- January I -March 6. 
Leader, Al Schmitz, 2901 Holyrood Dr., Oakland, CA 94611. 
Two base camps will be established in Tasmania. For one 
week we will camp at a beach on the western coast, a wilderness 
untouched by man. For another we will base at Mt. Field Park 
to visit its high plateaus. In two weeks spent in New Zealand 
we will visit Roturua, and travel for seven days through the 
forests of Urewera Park on a packhorse trip. One week will be 
spent in a ski chalet at Tongariro Park in which we will hike 
and climb. The trip will require a moderate ability for knap­
sacking with personal equipment in some parts of the trip. 
Cost is approx. $1500 plus air fare for the five weeks. 

(410) Galapagos Islands, Ecuador , .January 28-February 18. 
Leader, H. Stewart Kimball, 19 Owl Hill Rd., Orinda, CA 
94563. 
The Galapagos are one of nature's wonderlands each outdoor 
lover should visit at least once. We shall have unusual oppor­
tunity of intimate approach to these wonders by sailing in 2 
small vessels equipped with auxiliary engines, accommodating 
10 and 6 passengers each, operated by Julian Fitter, experi­
enced sailor and guide. Because of the size of the vessels we 
will be able to visit islands not available to larger groups. This 
is the warm season, the islands will be green and tropical, and 
the swimming and snorkeling will be excellent. The group 
meets in Miami, flies to Quito, and takes the autocarril to 
Guayaquil, a fantastic ride through the life zones from sub­
alpine to tropical. Land cost is approx. $1200 plus air fare. 

(415) Kenya Saddle and Grune Viewing Trip-January 29-
February 21. Optional Blue Nile River Run, Ethiopia-Feb­
ruary 18-29. Leader, Tony Church, Nairobi; coordinator, Al 
Schmitz, 2901 Holyrood Dr., Oakland, CA 94611. 
Ten days of horseback riding from Nairobi to Lake Naivasha 
and Samburu Game Refuge will allow a close study of wild 

game and a peaceful contemplation of the Rift Valley. Ex­
perience in riding is of advantage but not necessary. One week 
of game viewing by Landrover is included. Cost approximately 
$147~ plus air fare. Optional river run in Ethiopia is unique 
expenence, at extra cost. 

(430) Trisuli-Gatlang Valleys, Nepal-March. Leader, Tris 
Coffin, 500 Tamalpais Ave., Mill Valley, CA 94941. 
This springtime trek includes the most fascinating biotic areas 
in central Nepal, from a visit to the jungle Terai on the Indian 
border to the great hemlock and rhododendron forests of the 
inner Himalaya. We cross a 12,000-foot pass dropping into 
the upper Mailung drainage near a glacier at the foot of one 
of the Himalayan giants. We will complete our circle trip to 
Trisuli Bazaar via the western ridge of the Mailung River. 
Travel by elephant, Landrover, air and foot will include a 
trade route to Tibet and the seldom-visited Gatlang Valley. 
Cost is approximately $1300 'plus air fare. 

(435} Gurkha Himal, Nepal-April (3 weeks). Leader, Bob 
Stout, 10 Barker Ave., Fairfax, CA 94930. 
Spring in Nepal offers remarkable contrasts, with the snowy 
Himalayan peaks and rhododendrons in full bloom coinciding 
with the annual bird migration of over 200 species. This 18-day 
trek will visit the home of the 18th-century warriors who con­
quered Kathmandu Valley and formed the present Nepalese 
culture. We will be accompanied by a naturalist who will assist 
in identification of plants and wildlife. We will also have time 
for sightseeing trips in the Kathmandu Valley, Bhodnath, 
Patan, Swayambodnath. This is a moderate trek with a max­
imum elevation of 15,000 feet. Cost is approximately $1300 
plus air fare. 

(438) A Spring Outing to Japan-April 17-May 15. Leader, 
Claude A. Look, 411 Los Ninos Way, Los Altos, CA 94022. 
"Sakura No Hana"- cherry blossom time spreads northward 
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as we travel with the blooms to areas seldom seen by tourists. 
Ryokans, public transportation and people blend with our 
way of Japanese living. Activities for hikers and non-hikers as 
well as views of Mt. Fuji and Kyoto. Cost is approximately 
$ll00 plus air fare. 

(439) Spain: Central Pyrenees-Late May-June. Leaders, 
Aurora Dorado of Spain and Lewis Clark, 1349 Bay St., 
Alameda, CA 94501. 
Two to three weeks of moderate trail hiking in the scenic 
central Pyrenees with a swing into France through pic­
turesque Gavarnie south of Lourdes. Hike over 9,000-foot 
passes near massive Mont Perdido and maybe climb Pico 
Aneto (highest of the range). Walk through rugged cirques, 
bucolic valleys, around lakes of the Maladeta, visit historic 
monasteries, explore wild areas off the beaten track, stay in 
mountain refugios, albergos, a parador. Ride in charter ve­
hicles between base points. Estimated cost from Barcelona, 
$770. 

(447) Walking in Norway-July 7-23. Guide, Arnold Stener­
sen from Norway; Leader, Betty Osborn, 515 Shasta Way, 
Mill Valley, CA 94941. 
A delightful combination of a high mountain trek in Norway's 
Rondane Mountains, partly through a national park; and 
boat travel and walks through the best of the famous fjord 
country along the West Coast. Our transportation will include 
train, bus, ferry boat, and motor boat. There is daylight 
around the clock at this time of year with extensive glaciers 
and sparkling waterfalls at their best. Moderate to easy hiking 
for experienced walkers. Estimated cost, $525 plus air fare. 

(455) South American Parks-July (4 weeks). Leader, Howard 
Mitchell, 65 Hillside Ave., San Anselmo, CA 94960. 
On the Pacific Coast of Colombia are some nearly untouched 
jungles of South America. There will be a 10-day dugout 
canoe trip along the trailless Choco coast with camping in bays 
and an excursion up river to visit the Bora Bora Indians. Look 
for orchids and jungle birds in an area proposed for a Co­
lombian Park. In the Parque Nacional Huascaran of Peru we 
shall hike and camp for two weeks below the snowcapped 
Andes about 12,000 feet elevation. Four weeks ground cost 
$1150 estimated plus air fare. 

(445) Northern Frontier District, Kenya-July 1-28. Leader, 
Tony Church, Nairobi; coordinator, Al Schmitz, 2901 Holy­
rood Dr., Oakland, CA 94611. 
Starting from Nairobi in Landrovers, tented base camps will 
be established at the Mara River in Masai Mara, by a lake at 
Maraia!, on top of Mt. Marsabit by the shores of Lake Para­
dise, and at the Nyuru River in the Samburu Game Refuge, 
alternated by occasional stays in lodges while traveling be­
tween camps. The trip offers a great variety of game viewing, 
scenery, and native people. Cost about $1450 plus air fare. 

(448) Austrian and Swiss Alps-July 17-Aug. 3. Leaders, Brad 
Hogue, 3750 Long Ave., Beaumont, TX 77706 and Wayne R. 
Woodruff, P.O. Box 614, Livermore, CA 94550. 
Wandern the trails of the Austrian and Swiss AJps through 
valleys and over high passes skirting the glaciers which inch 
down from the ridges on the Italian border. Days of moderate 
hiking lead to Alpine Club or mountain huts where food, 
lodging and good company awajt. We will spend about a week 
in Austria's Stubai Valley and a week in Switzerland, traveling 
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between by train or postbus. Leader approval is required; 
minimum age is 11. Approximate cost $500 plu~ air fare. 

(460) Indonesia: Java, Bali, Sulawesi-July-August (five 
weeks). Leader, Ray Simpson, 2907 Pine St., Berkeley, CA 
94705. 
An in-depth view of the culture and ecology of this exotic land, 
led by a former resident. The itinerary includes the nature 
preserve of Udjung Kulon (home of the one-horned rhino); 
snorkeling among pristine coral gardens; a visit to Jogjakarta, 
the cultural and art center of Java; an optional climb of the 
famed volcano, Gunung Bromo; the "Spice Island" of Sula­
wesi; and a final week of emersion into the fabulous life of 
Bali ... unique dances, colorful temple ceremonies of a gentle 
and friendly people. Cost will be approximately $1000 (land 
portion) and $1300 air fare. 

(475) Hiking and Canoeing in Sweden and Swedish Lapland­
July 22-August 12. Leaders, Mary and Ross Miles, 18 Farm 
Rd:, Los Altos, CA 94022. 
This trip combines canoeing in the Varmland District of 
Sweden with hiking above the Arctic Circle in Lapland. For 
8 days we paddle through a lovely chain of lakes. An overnight 
train carries us to Kiruna where we start our 8 days of hiking. 
We spend 1 or 2 days at Kebnekaise. While hiking the Kungs­
leden we stay in mountain huts and lodges along the way. Our 
trail takes us through the birch forests of Abisko National 
Park, Europe's last wilderness area. Cost is approximately 
$745 plus air fare. 

(480) Greenland-early August (16 days). Leader, Jim Watters, 
600 Caldwell Road, Oakland, CA 94611. 
A first for the club, this novel trip visits Greenland's southern 
tip, where the eternal ice-sheet has retreated as far as fifty miles 
from the sea to unfold a wild, breathtaking land of granite­
walled fjords and grey-green mountainscape. The summer sun 
exposes uncounted lakes and tarns. The trip starts at Narssars­
suaq on Erik's Fjord, scouting among the old Norse ruins in 
the district. We will then walk a glacier, and backpack through 
highland valleys to Julianehab, a trek of about six days. A 
leisurely boat trip follows, connecting Igaliko Fjord with 
Skovfjord (Erik's). Cost approximately $450 plus air fare. 

(450) Galapagos Islands, Ecuador-August 9-September 2. 
Leaders, Betty Osborn, 515 Shasta Way, Mill Valley, CA 
94941, & Salem Rice. 
For 22 days by sailing vessel and on land we will explore these 
starkly beautiful islands, walking among fierce looking marine 
and land iguanas and great tortoises, visiting bird colonies 
unique to each island, and watching sea lions at play in tidal 
pools. Wonderful swimming and nature photography. Ex­
cursions and overnight hikes will visit volcanoes, rain forests 
and the Darwin Research Station. Estimated land cost, $1200 
plus air fare. 

Beverly F. Steveson 



(483) Walking in Wales-August/September. Leaders, Lori 
and Chris Loosley, c/o IBM (UK) Ltd., Addiscombe Rd., 
Croydon, U.K. 
Two weeks of hiking in the mountainous and ruggedly beauti­
ful National Parks of Wales. From the bleak hills of the 
Brecon Beacons to the coastal grandeur of Pembrokeshire and 
finally to Snowdonia, a green and misty mountain range of a , 
thousand moods. We shall stay at farmhouses and meet the 
Welsh-musical, poetic people who are proud of their own 
language and culture and who have always resisted the phys­
ical and cultural invasions of the English. Price approximately 
$500 plus air fare. 

(485) The Netherlands Afoot and Afloat-September (3 weeks). 
Leaders, Ellis and Margaret Rother, 903 Sunset Dr., San 
Carlos, CA 94070. 
We shall leave the big cities to the tourists, exploring the great 
delta waterways; sanctuaries for bird and animal life on and 
around the islands along the northern shores of Holland, 
visiting small villages, traveling for miles through meadows, 
on and along canals, following the eastern shore of the Zeider 
Zee to campsites in the wooded hills of Arnheim, site of the 
greatest airborne battle of all time. Thence to Breda near the 
Belgian border. Our purpose: to examine and assess the de­
velopment, the people, the natural resources, open space 
animal life, and plant life. Cost approximately $750 plus 
air fare. 

(510) Kenya Mountains to the Sea-September 30-October 22. 
Optional Seychelles Islands or Omo River Run, Ethiopia­
October 21-30. Leader, Al Schmitz, 2901 Holyrood Dr., Oak­
land, CA 94611. 
From a base camp at Masai Mara the itinerary will take us via 
Mt. Kenya and Meru National Park to the coastal area at 
Lamu, an ancient Arab town on an island in the Indian Ocean. 
From there we will traverse Tsavo National Park to our camp 
at Amboseli near Mt. Kilimanjaro. Game drives and hikes, 
·several days of boating on the Tana River, and beach combing 
will furnish a variety of experiences with little or no difficulty. 
Cost approximately $1500 plus air fare. The optional trips are 
described in supplement. 

(515) Ganesh Himal-Gurkha Himal, Nepal-October (25 days). 
Leader, Edith Reeves, 1739 E. San Miguel, Phoenix, AZ 85010. 
Twenty-five days of trekking, perhaps with a naturalist to visit 
the home of the 18th-centuryGurkha warriors who conquered 
Kathmandu Valley and formed the present Nepalese culture. 
The first part of the trek is all Tamongs, the second all Gu­
rungs; both tribes have maintained identity with unique dress 
and customs. The maximum elevation is 15,000 feet, a moder­
ate trek. Cost is approximately $1375 plus air fare. 

(520) Annapurna Circle, Nepal-November. Leader, John 
Edginton, 2733 Buena Vista Way, Berkeley, CA 94708. 
To circle the massifs of Annapurna, Lamjung and Ganesh 
Himals is the goal of this relatively strenuous 25-day trek 
promising unparalleled views of these great peaks. We cross 
Thong La at 17,000 feet to return by the great river gorge of 
the Kali Gandaki far below and between the towering peaks 
of the Annapurna and Dhaulagiri Himals. Should snow block 
the high passes, we will explore beautiful Marsyandi Valley 
returning down that valley. Cost is approximately $1375 plus 
air fare. 

· (525) Natural History Trek through Kathmandu Valley, Nepal 
- late November-early December. Naturalist, Dr. Robert L. 
Fleming, Sr., Kathmandu; coordinator, Al Schmitz, 2901 
Holyrood Dr., Oakland, CA 94611. 
Fifty miles Jong Kathmandu Valley (4500 feet) is surrounded 
by mountains about 10,000 feet, offering splendid views of the 
entire Nepal Himalayas. Rain forests are rich in plant life, 
and bird life is especially varied at this time of year. A two­
weeks' trek will furnish a cross section of the natural history 
and the cultures of the local inhabitants. A two-day trip to 
Tiger Tops in the Terai is included. Approximate cost $1000 
plus air fare for a three weeks' outing. 

Wayne R. Woodruff 

Mexican/ Guatemalan 
Boat Trips 
(406) River of Ruins Raft Trip, Rio Usumacinta, Guatemala 
and Mexico-March 4-16. Leader, Frank Hoover, 900 Veteran 
Ave., Los Angeles, CA 90024. 
This tropical jungle trip starts at Tikal and ends at Palenque. 
During the raft portion of the trip we will visit other ruins, 
Yaxchilan, Piedras Negras and some minor sites reachable 
only by raft. We will visit settlements along the river and have 
opportunities to view wildlife including monkeys, numerous 
birds and other exotic creatures. Members will run the boats. 
For active, experienced campers; minimum age 12. Cost will 
be approximately $650 plus air fare. 

(407) Sea of Cortez Leisure Boat Trip-April 3-10. Leader, 
Rouen Faith, 6122 Montgomery Ct., San Jose, CA 95135. 
(408) April 10-17. Monroe Agee, 13750 Rivulet Rd., San Jose, 
CA 95124. 
Our 1975 trip was so successful, we are making two trips in 
1976. The cruise is an adventure in sea life, designed to meet 
the requirements of both the physically active and lazier ones. 
The first trip will go from La Paz to San Felipe and the second 
trip will return to La Paz. This is a coastal trip along the east 
coast of Baja California. Along the way we will visit exotic 
islands and observe the abundant sea life of whales, dolphins, 
sea lions, frigate birds, boobies and pelicans as they go about 
their undisturbed way. Approx. cost $545 round trip from 
San Diego includes air fare to La Paz. 
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Foreign Underwater 
(418) Grand Cayman, British West Indies-January 4-13. 
Leader, Kent Schellenger, 248 C Calle Marguerita, Los Gatos, 
CA 95030. 
Reef exploration is the theme of this trip to a favorite dive site, 
an hour from Miami. (fhe winter weather is beautiful!) The 
shallow reef just offshore is alive with coral, sponge, and fish. 
Deeper reefs accessible by boat offer spectacular underwater 
vistas. Toe leader and resort staff will help with scuba and 
photo skills and marine life identification. Evening films will 
add to appreciation of the reef. Cost, about $760, covers all 
but air fare; $540 for non-divers. 

(419) Galapagos Islands, Ecuador-May 6-29. Leader, Ann 
Gladwin, 526 Pine Wood a., Los Gatos, CA 95030. 
Daily land excursions across lava flows, encounters with fear­
less birds, iguanas, and giant tortoises, are complemented by 
scuba diving. Rarely seen even by scientists, Galapagos under­
water offers tropical fish co-existing with sea lions, penguins 
and turtles, and endemic species like the diving marine iguana. 
We live and sail on the 63-foot ketch Sulidae. Leader is a 
YMCA scuba instructor who has dived the Galapagos. For 
certified, experienced divers. About $1850 excluding air fare; 
$1550 for accompanying non-divers. 

(420) Grand Cayman, British West Indies: Tropical Reef 
Biology-June 4-15. Leader-Instructor, Steve Webster, Box 
293, La Honda, CA 94020. 
A college-level course, for casual or credit participation, is 
offered by the leader, a NAUI Instructor and professor of ma­
rine biology. The course covers biology, natural history, 
ecology, and identification of marine organisms. Open to 
certified divers (and accompanying non-divers at lower rates). 
Cost of about $760 covers everything except air fare. 

(421) Grand Cayman, British West Indies, Tropical Reef 
Biology (lntermediate)-June 16-27. Leader, Steve Webster, 
Box 293, La Honda, CA 94020. 
Open to all certified divers, this trip is especially for alumni 
of previous biology trips or those with some background. It 
includes instruction in marine biology and participation in 
research projects. Daily diving will consist of research dives 
with particular objectives. Exact nature of the project(s) will 
be determined by background and interests of participants. 
Cost of about $760 (less for participants of trip 420) covers all 
but air fare. 

(422) Belize Barrier Reef- June 19-July 2. Leader, Kent 
Schellenger, 248 C Calle Marguerita, Los Gatos, CA 95030. 
British Honduras and a reef second only to Australia's is the 
site of this new trip. It offers simple, attractive accommoda­
tions, unlimited snorkeling and diving in rich and colorful 
waters. A basic scuba course for novices and daily boat diving 
for certified divers are planned, but snorkelers will be busy, 
too. After the trip, tours can be made to Mayan ruins in Belize 
or Guatemala. Belize is an hour from Miami, New Orleans, 
and Mexico City. Cost of about $700 covers all but air fare. 

(423) Fiji and Tonga-July 7-27. Leader, Ann Gladwin, 526 
Pine Wood Ct., Los Gatos, CA 95030. 
On Fiji, divers will stay in Suva and Lautoka, with daily ex­
cursions to the outer islands. Highlight of the Fiji stay will be 
an overnight boat trip to Astrolabe, an island with "the best 
diving in Fiji." On Tonga, the pace will be leisurely. At 
present there are no scuba facilities, but fine snorekling, inter­
esting sight-seeing and shopping. Plans are still in progress 
but may include days in Western Samoa. About $1950 in­
cludes air fare from San Francisco. 

IT'S NOT TOO LATE FOR A 
WILDERNESS TRIP IN 1975 

More than 85% of all places on our 1975 Wilderness outings have already been 
spoken for, and quite a few trips are completely filled with a waiting list. But hun­
dreds of places are still unfilled on other outings. If you start right now, you may 
be able to get a reservation for yourself or for your family. Each of the following trips 
had several vacancies available at press time. 

Trip 
Number 

ALASKA 
10 Admiralty Island Canoe Trip 

BASE CAMP 
32 Lost Lake Alpine Camp, Sequoia P ark, Sierra 
34 Agate Springs, Rocky Mtn. Camp, Absarokas, MT 
40 Lost Lake Alpine Camp, Sequoia Park, Sierra 
48 Palisades Mountaineering Camp, Inyo Forest, Sierra 
50 Chittenden Lake, Sierra Forest, Sierra 
51 Badger Lakes, Inyo Forest, Sierra 
53 Death Valley Christmas Camp, California 

**Children under 12 $175. 

BICYCLE 
58 Island of Hawaii 

*Per person deposit; includes Hawaii round-trip air fare. 

BURRO 
60 Chain Lakes, Yosemite Park, Sierra 
61 North Fork of the San Joaquin River, Sierra 
64 Hawksbeak Peak, Toiyabe Forest, Sierra 
65 Suicide Ridge, Y osenrite Park, Sierra 

Da"' 
Trip Cost 

(Incl. Deposi.l) Deposit Leader 

July 13-20 

July 6-18 
July 13- 25 
July 20-Aug. 1 
Aug. 9- 16 
Aug. 3- 15 
Aug. 3- 15 
Dec. 21- 30 

320 

185 
215 
185 
140 
200** 
200 
160 

July 31- Aug. 18 570 

July 2-9 
July 9-16 
Aug. 10-17 
Aug. 18- 25 

125 
125 
125 
125 

50 

25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 

Sandy Sagalkin 

Bob Miller 
John Freiermuth 
Steve Devoto 
Sy Ossofsky 
Joanne Barnes 
Jerry Fritzke 
Ray Des Camp 

25* Paul DeWitt 

25 
25 
25 
25 

Jack McClure 
Don White 
Doug Parr 
Brett White 



Trip 
Number Date 

Trip Cost 
(Incl. Deposit) Deposit 

FAMILY TRIPS (Other trips with family rates are listed under Base Camps.) 

Family Canoe 
Parents Each 
and one add I. 

child child 

95 Adirondack Lakes Teen-Age Trip, New York July 27-Aug. 2 335 & 115 25 

FOREIGN 1975* (Total cost is approximate and does not include air fare.) 
621 Kenya: Northern Frontier, East Africa July 20-Aug. 16 1470 
017 Walking the Mathews Range, Kenya, East Africa Sept. 7-30 1500 
635 Annapurna Circle Trek, Nepal Sept. 27-0ct. 30 1300 
647 Angel Falls, Venezuela Nov. 8-23 1450** 
033 Tassili N'Ajjer Camel Caravan, Algeria, Sahara Nov. 13- Dec. 1 1325 
648 Patagonia, Falkland Islands Nov. 28-Jan. 3 1400 

*Per person deposit. 
**Includes round-trip air fare from Miami. 

HAWAII (Other Hawaii Trips are listed under Bicycle, Underwater Exploration.) 
108 Island of Hawaii (Makai) Dec. 22-31 545* 

*Per person deposit; includes Hawaii round-trip air fare; Children under 12 $450. 

HIGH-LIGHT 
ll5 Willmore-Jasper Parks, Canada July 21- Aug. 1 280 
US Mt. Robson-Jasper Parks, Canada Aug. 3- 14 285 
120 Idaho Primitive Area, Payette Forest, Idaho Aug. 3- 15 310 
125 Twin Lakes, Kings Canyon Park, Sierra Sept. 1-8 195 
126 Kaweah Country, Sierra Sept. 8-15 195 
127 Horseshoe Canyon-Cataract Canyon Boat-Light, Utah Sept. 14- 25 395 
128 Upper Escalante Canyons, Utah Sept. 20--27 205 
129 Under the Rim, Bryce Canyon Park, Utah Sept. 27-0ct. 4 205 
130 Southern Arizona Desert Dec. 27- Jan. 1 130 

KNAPSACK (Other Knapsack Trips are listed under Alaska, Canoe.) 
147 Miter Basin, Sequoia Park, Sierra July 12-20 83 
149 Pellisier Flats, White Mountains, California July 13-20 73 
151 Mount Woodworth, Kings Canyon Park, Sierra July 14-25 115 
157 Adirondack Forest Preserve, New York July 20--26 105 
141 Shotgun Pass, Sequoia Park, Sierra July 25- Aug. 4 104 
166 Baffin Island National Park, Canada July 27- Aug. 14 845* 
158 Black Forest, Pennsylvania Aug. 10--16 105 
185 Goddard-Tehipite, Sierra Forest-Kings Canyon, Sierra Aug. 22-Sept. 4 135 
186 Toroweap Point, Grand Canyon, Arizona Sept. 21- 27 105 
187 Nankoweap-Salt Trails, Grand Canyon, Arizona Oct. 5- 11 90 
189 Sierra del Carmen, Texas-Old Mexico Dec. 27- 31 100 

*Includes round-trip air fare from Montreal. 

Mentally Retarded Adult Knapsack 
191 Collegiate Peaks, Colorado Aug. 4-8 93 

Juniors Knapsack 
203 Little Claire Lake, Sequoia Park, Sierra July 17- 24 85 
101 Blackcap Basin, John Muir Wilderness, Sierra July 18-27 90 

SADDLE-LIGHT 
214 Flints Park, Canadian Rockies, Alberta,' canada Aug. 11- 20 430 

SERVICE* 
Clean-Up Projects 

219 Golden Trout Wilderness Restoration, Montana July 17- 27 50 

Special Projects 
235 The Olympic Sherpa, Washington July 20--Aug. 8 65 

Trail Maintenance Projects 
239 Piute Pass, John Muir Wilderness, Sierra July 15-25 50 
241 Krebs Creek/ Chain Lakes, High Uintas, Utah July 20-30 50 
242 Deep Creek, Teton Ranger District, Montana July 20-30 50 
243 Deer Lake, Spanish Peaks, Montana July 29- Aug. 8 50 
245 Deep Creek, Teton Ranger District, Montana Aug. 1- 11 50 
246 Harrison Lake Backpack Selkirk Range, Idaho Aug. 3-14 50 
247 Piute Pass, John Muir Wilderness, Sierra Aug. 16-26 50 
248 Wahoo Pass, Selway-Bitterroot Wilderness, Idaho Aug. 21- 31 50 

*Per person deposit. 

50 
50 
50 
50 
50 
50 

25 

25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 

25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 

25 

25 
25 

25 

25 

25 

25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 

Leader 

Lyle Seeger 

Ross Miles 
Al Schmitz 
Tris Coffin 
Ted Snyder 
Al Schmitz 
Harold Seielstad 

Pete Nelson 

Mary Lou & Al Combs 
Mary Lou & Al Combs 
Jeff Thompson 
Stuart Dole 
George Hall 
Don Lyngholm 
Allen Malmquist 
Allen Malmquist 
John Ricker 

Larry Pohl 
Eric Bergh 
Gordon Peterson 
Walter Blank 
Ellen Howard 
Keith Olson 
Ludwig Bohler 
Bill Colvig 
Don Campbell 
c/ o John Ricker 
David Goss 

Joie Hartman 

Sherri Brainard 
Vicky & Bill Hoover 

Neil Jones 

Bruce Kingsley 

Bill Reeve 

Mike Bade 
Jon Wellman 
Alan Schmierer 
Bruce Kingsley 
Sleppy & Johnson 
Alan Schmierer 
Steve Silverman 
Brian O'Regan 
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Date 
Trip Cost 

(Incl. Deposit) Deposit Leader 

UNDERWATER EXPLORATION* 
317 Virgin Islands 
256 Kona Coast, Hawaii 

*Per person deposit. 
**$160 additional for divers and student divers. 

July 10-21 
Aug. 5-14 

620** 
730*** 

50 
50 

Bob Sextro 
Kent Schellenger 

***Includes Hawaii round-trip air fare; persons joining in Hawaii $440; divers $100 additional; children under 12 $660. 

WATER TRIPS 
River Raft (Other River Raft Trips are listed under High-Lights.) 

275 Rogue River, Oregon Aug. 11-15 
276 "R iver of No Return" Main Salmon, Idaho Aug. 16-21 
278 Chilcotin-Fraser Rivers, B.C., Canada Aug. 17- 26 
279 Middle Fork of the Salmon River, Idaho Aug. 19- 24 
280 Hells Canyon of the Snake River, Idaho Aug. 25-30 

*Per person deposit. 

Canoe (Other Canoe trips are listed under Alaska.) 
289 Upper Missouri River, Montana 
290 Delaware River, New York-Penna.-New J ersey 
292 Snake River, Grand T etons, Wyoming 
293 Kipawa R eserve Exploration, Quebec, Canada 
294 Willamette River, Oregon 
297 Niobrara River, Nebraska 
298 Rio Grande Canyons, Texas 
299 Boquillas Canyon Canoe-Knapsack, Texas 

tCanoes included in trip cost. 

BOAT TRIP 
328 Puerto Vallarta, Mexico 

*Per person deposit. 

July 1- 6 
J uly 13-19 
Aug. 3- 9 
Aug. 3-15 
Aug. 17-23 
Sept. 28- Oct. 4 
Oct. 11- 17 
Nov. 23-29 

Nov. 3- 15 

205 
325 
670 
375 
325 

93 
160t 
165 
195 
155 
150t 
105 
90 

** 

25 Martin Friedman 
25 John Barnard 
50* Monroe Agee 
25 Harry Neal 
25 Frank Hoover 

25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 
25 

Ellen & Bob Wilkinson 
Frank Springman 
Frankie Stratbairn 
Dick Williams 
Ann Dwyer 
Ron K urtzer 
John Baker 
D avid Hollingsworth 

50* Ellis Rother 

**About $590 from Los Angeles, about $550 from San Antiono and about $440 from Puerto Vallarta. 

IMPORTANT NOTICE! Sierra Club outings are subject to all 
Outing Department policies on reservations, cancellations, re­
funds and transfers printed in the 1975 Outing Issue of the Sierra 
Club Bulletin. A copy of these rules may be obtained from the 
Outing Department. Members are urged to check policy before 
making reservations. · 

SUPPLEMENTAL INFORMATION 
Write for the Trip Supplement for the specific 
outing which interests you, to Sierra Club 
Outings, 1050 Mills Tower, San Francisco, 
CA 94104. Foreign Outing supplements will be 
sent as soon as available. Send 50c for each' 
supplement requested beyond the first five. 

MAIL TO: SIERRA CLUB OUTING DEPT. - P.O. BOX 7959 RINCON ANNEX, SAN FRANCISCO, CA. 94120 

-----------------------------------------------------------------
MEMBERSHIP NO. (CHECK BULLETIN LABEL) Trip number Trip name Departure date 

Print Name: FIRST LAST 
Mr. DEPOSIT ENCLOSED (Leave blank) No. of resllrva-
Mrs. lions requested Miss $ 

Mailing Address 

City 

I 
State I Zip Code 

Residence telephone (area code) 

I 
Business telephone (area code) 

PLEASE PRINT YOUR NAME AND THE NAMES OF ALL FAMILY MEMBERS GOING ON THIS OUTING A1e Relationship 
How many national 

Membership No. trips (not chapter) 
have you eone on! 

I. 

2. 

3. 

·•· 
5. 

6. 



COST INDEXING 
THE 
ENVIRONMENT 

Who writes those anonymous 
documents called environmental 

impact statements? Our author, 
among others. Here she tells what 

it's like and how it's done 

BARBARA-ANN G. LEWIS 

THE ENVIRONMENT AL Impact 
Statement (EIS) is a document 

issued by a federal agency planning a 
major action. These documents are 
faceless affairs, anonymous except for 
the name of a project manager to be 
contacted when necessary. Who are 
the people who write these pages? 
What are their technical backgrounds 
or expertise? What are their personal 
philosophies and to what extent do 
these influence the statements? Is any 
pressure exerted upon individual writ­
ers to prepare a statement slanted in a 
particular direction? This article will 
attempt to answer these questions, 
with particular reference to environ­
mental impact statements issued by 
the U.S. Atomic Energy Commission 
(AEC, now NRC). It must be empha­
sized that the experiences and opin­
ions expressed herein are strictly those 
of the author. 

I was hired by Argonne National 
Laboratory in the spring of 1972 to 
write environmental impact state­
ments for nuclear power stations. As 
a result of the Calvert Cliffs decision, 
the ABC contracted with Argonne 
to prepare such statements. (Other 
statements are prepared for the AEC 
by Oak Ridge National Laboratory 
and Battelle Northwest.) Argonne 
initially drew from its staff of engi­
neers, physicists, chemists, and biolo­
gists to form the Environmental State• 
meot Project (ESP). Within the first 
year, as the original troupe returned 
to their research, ESP began hiring 
new personnel expressly for the pur­
pose of writing the statements. I 
was one of these new employees and 
presented myself as a professional soil 
scientist, an environmentalist with a 
grain of salt. I was not fanatically op­
posed to anything except nuclear and 
biological warfare. I was struck by 
the enthusiasm of the ESP staff to do 
the best possible job of assessing envi­
ronmental impacts despite the pauc-

ity of data and possible outside pres­
sures. I accepted a one-year postdoc­
toral appointment, and although the 
thought of abandoning pure research 
even for a while was upsetting, I was 
fired with eagerness to do my part in 
preventing or minimizing some of the 
damage being done by my species 
upon the small, mute earth. 

My first months on the project were 
spent reading, day and night, on many 
aspects of our environment that I 
knew little or nothing about. Hither­
to, for example, a fish was a pretty 
thing that lived in the water and had a 
lot of bones when you ate it. Now I 
was called upon to assess the impact 
of warm water on fish, and not just any 
fish, but very specific fish. I learned 
about life histories, migration and 
spawning habits, thermal and chemi­
cal tolerances, synergistic relation­
ships, diseases, and so on. I also 
learned that we know these things 
only in a general way, that in a given 
area in a given river or lake, in some 
isolated part of a given state, there are 
very few data, if any, on the fish and 
other aquatic organisms that live 
there. 

It was also necessary to learn about 
the innards of a nuclear power plant. 
I learned about the core and "rad. 
waste" systems, turbines, gland seals, 
pumps, condenser tube materials, etc., 
etc. Io the many months to come I was 
to learn that engineers and biologists, 

· as groups, tend to look at a particular 
problem in different ways. For ex­
ample, it wasn't at all clear to me why 
dry cooling towers could not be used 
everywhere, and thus eliminate the 
need for all that cooling water. The 
engineers patiently explained to me 
about wet- and dry-bulb temperatures, 
turbine back pressures, and dollar 
costs. On the other hand, the engi­
neers could not understand why I was 
concerned about the well-being of in­
sect larvae. After all, insects were• 
pests, right? I patiently explained 
about food chains {which the engi-

neers could accept), and tried to inter­
ject my own philosophy about man's 
place among the species {which the 
engineers could not accept). 

Our group of about 40 individuals 
included engineers, physicists, chem­
ists, geologists, a meteorologist, and 
a hodgepodge of biologists (micro­
biologists, terrestrial ecologists, wild­
life biologists, botanists, aquatic biol­
ogists, fisheries biologists, soil scien­
tists). Like the hedgehog and the 
tortoise of Kipling's story, little by 
little the engineers began sounding 
like biologists, and biologists began 
walking around with calculators in 
their pockets. No name, comparable 
to Kipling's armadillo, has yet been 
given to the person who emerges after 
two or more years of writing environ­
mental impact statements. (I refuse to 
accept the term "fat bureaucrat." ) To 
borrow from Dr. Alvin Weinberg, 
former director of Oak Ridge Na­
tional Laboratory, perhaps "traoscien­
tist" would be appropriate. Whatever 
it is, what we do is certainly not 
Science in the traditional sense of the 
word. We have no laboratory, no 
equipment, and no time. We do have 
pads of paper, pencils, libraries, a 
phone to anyone in the U.S., and dead­
lines. We also have the volumes en­
titled " Environmental Report," which 
are submitted to the AEC by a utility 
as part of its application for a license 
to construct or operate a nuclear 
power station. And we have the 
AEC's project managers, branch 
chiefs, and lawyers. 

An environmental impact statement 
issued by the ~C may evolve as fol­
lows, starting from the day Argonne 
receives several copies of the utility's 
Environmental Report (ER) from 
ABC headquarters. A team is selected 
by our deputy manager, and usually 
consists of two or three biologists, an 
engineer, a physicist, a chemist, a 
geologist, and a meteorologist. One 
is designated as team leader. An indi­
vidual may be serving on two or three 
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teams simultaneously, at various stages 
of the work . 

The team spends about two weeks 
studying the ER and preparing ques­
tions to the utility. In my experience, 
no ER has been completely adequate 
in terms of supplying information 
necessary for an assessment . However, 
except for a few cases where th e ER 
was totally rejected by the AEC, the 
deficiencies in these reports can be 
corrected by requests for additional 
information, which is subsequently 
supplied by the utility as supplements 
to the ER. 

The team then makes a three- to 
four-day visit to the site of the pro­
posed nuclear power station. Depend­
ing on the interests of the particular 
team member, one wades around in 
the water , another picks up a clump 
of soil, another frowns at a particular 
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shrub. No one pretends it is "field 
work," but it gives the impact-state­
ment writer a better idea of the site 
than merely reading about it in the 
ER. A practiced eye can look at a 
river bank and make a pretty good 
guess at the tendency for erosion dur­
ing construction, and wh at erosion­
preventive measures should be im­
posed on the utility . T h e term 
"wooded area" conjures up a different 
picture for a person reared in nor th­
ern California than for a person 
reared in Illinois, and a first-hand ob­
servation of a particular "wooded 
area" can modify any preconceptions. 
The site visit also provides meetings 
with the utility's environmental con­
sultants, who are often well-qualified 
scientists but limited in their field 
work by budget restrictions. The 
team also meets with state and county 

"Th ey used to be thought of as crackpots" 
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officials, as well as other groups or 
individuals, to inquire into local con­
cerns about the siting of the station. 

Back in a little cubicle at Argonne, 
the statement writer buckles down to 
work, spending six to nine weeks 
plowing and replowing through the 
ER, searching through and studying 
the scientific literature, picking the 
brains of outside scientists via tele­
phone calls and letters, pestering the 
utility and its consultants for more 
details. There is much communication 
among the team members: the biolo­
gist needs to know how hot that 
thermal plume will be, and how much 
of the waterway it will occupy. He 
hounds the physicist for answers. 
That physicist is trying to model the 
thermal plume and hounds the hydrol­
ogist for data on seasonal river flow 
velocities. The cost-benefit man needs 
to know how many fish and plankton 
will be lost due to the power plant and 
hounds the biologist. All of them are 
hounded by the team leader who is 
conscious of the deadline rushing at 
him. Nor is it always that orderly. The 
cost-benefit man becomes irritated 
because the biologist cannot give him 
a number for fish that will be killed on 
the water-intake screens. The biolo­
gist is irritated because even if he 
could give such a number, he doesn't 
know what that number means in 
terms of the well-being of that partic­
ular river system, because data on 
fish-population dynamics of that river 
are nonexistent or very meager. T he 
physicist is irritated at the inadequacy 
of available data on water tempera­
tures and stream-bed configuration. 
All may take out their irritation in 
various ways, e.g., by picking an argu­
ment with the hapless team leader or 
going home and kicking the dog. 

Finally, a preliminary draft environ­
mental statement (PDES) is put to­
gether with the help of a tech nical 
editor, and is then reviewed by a com­
pletely different team. Constructive 
criticism during this peer review does 
much to improve the document. Oc­
casionally, one or two individuals may 
get hot under the collar over a partic­
ular item (when there are seven biol­
ogists around a table, there will be 
seven different opinions ), but the 
good fellowship and mutual respect 
within the group at Argonne allows 
such conflict to occur without becom­
ing personal or long term . 

W ithin a day or two of this re­
Continued on page 30 



Toward a New Alliance 

Consumption and Environment 

CONSUMER GROUPS and environmental or­
ganizations both greatly broadened 

their interests in the late 1960's. The en­
vironmental movement, the natural off­
spring of early efforts to protect America's 
wilderness and wildlife, extended its con­
cerns to what were thought to be the under­
lying economic causes of environmental 
degradation. The consumer movement, 
which focused at first on product safety and 
marketing practices, began to address the 
issues-such as pricing and taxation policies 
-it believed to be the root causes of such 
problems. Throughout the formative years 
of both movements, there was little conflict 
between their goals; they shared a commu­
nity of interest on most issues and worked 
closely together on many others, particularly 
pollution. 

Now there are signs of a growing schism 
over one of the most basic of all issues­
energy policy. If this schism is allowed to 
widen, the interests of neither constituency 
will be served. To narrow the gap, both sides 
will have to give a little. 

Environmentalists have come to recognize 
that while we focus on the undesirable im­
pacts of energy-source exploitation, we must 
also get at the ultimate cause of those im­
pacts-increasing demand. 

In the last year, more and more people 
have come to accept the thesis that while 
laws, regulations, and standards are essen­
tial to improve our efficiency in the utiliza­
tion of energy resources, the price mech­
anism can also make a significant contribu­
tion toward this end. 

Because people tend to act primarily in 
their own self-interest-either for good or 
evil-society is forced to pay the costs of 
enforcing laws and regulations. But this 
same aspect of human nature suggests that, 
with respect to levels of energy consumption, 
that market forces can be particularly suc­
cessful in accomplishing some of the same 
purposes toward which the various laws and 
regulations are directed, i.e., reducing the 
impacts of energy-resource recovery. 

If prices contain the true "messages" 
about the actual environmental costs of ob­
taining and consuming energy, people will 
make socially desirable choices while oper­
ating in their own self-interest. They will 
purchase wisely, buying what they can really 
afford, saving money and reducing energy 
consumption simultaneously. 

But if we, as environmentalists, rely too 
much on this important principle, we may 

find ourselves out on a weak limb. As we 
continue to advocate the full internalization 
of environmental costs in the price of energy, 
we must also recognize that institutional 
changes will be necessary, and that there are 
limits to the costs that can be added to the 
system at any one time. We are now adjust­
ing, in some places painfully, to the end of 
the era of cheap energy. One obvious effect 
has been rising prices and unemployment. 
To insist that energy prices be increased 

· ·Throughout the formative 
years of both the environ­
mental and consumer 
movements. they shared a 
community of interest on 
most issues and worked 
closely together on many 
others. Now there are signs 
of a growing schism over 
one of the most basic of all 
issues~ energy policy. If 
this schism is al lowed to 
widen, the interests of 
neither constituency will 
be served. To narrow the 
gap, both groups will have 
to give a l ittle." 

overnight, without considering the impact 
of such increases on various sectors of the 
economy, may not be our best course for the 
moment. Instead, this may be the time to 
focus on bringing about the institutional 
changes that will make such increases 
palatable to the public. We can encourage 
the nation as a whole to: 

• Establish a national goal for energy 
conservation; 

• Set mandates for federal agencies that 
will cause them to implement energy­
conservation programs; 

• Augment and make more visible the 
energy-conservation program within the 
Federal Energy Administration; 

• Change policies that discourage the re­
cycling of materials; 

• Set efficiency standards for both auto-

mobiles and buildings. Leadership and 
visibility in such a national effort is badly 
needed; ultimately, it must come from the 
Administration. 

On the other hand, consumer groups 
seem to be crawling out on another weak 
limb in their efforts to redress the long­
standing distortions of the market place in 
the favor of the energy industry. In spite of 
much wishful thinking to the contrary, we 
do indeed have an "energy crisis," and we 
are most unlikely ever again to have inex­
pensive and abundant energy. We have a 
demand crisis more than a supply crisis. In 
other words, our demand for energy has in­
creased beyond the point where it can be 
gratified easily and cheaply. As the under­
developed nations increase their demands 
for the same resources, our share must nec­
essarily become smaller and what we pay for 
it is going to increase. Although this demand 
crisis may not be clearly perceived in this 
country without the hard light supply short­
ages in the form of gasoline lines to illumi­
nate it, it will remain with us like a shadow 
nonetheless. 

We hope that consumer groups will not 
try to compromise meaningful conservation 
measures in the hopes of a perennial, inex­
pensive abundance of energy. To use up our 
petroleum reserves now as a way of tempo­
rarily sustaining this illusion will only create 
a less certain future. A new "energy trust 
fund" (see the Washington Report) de­
signed to finance the development of energy 
resources ignores the demand crisis and sup­
poses that we can return to the good old 
days of cheap fuel. Even if this were possible 
-and it is not-such a fund could as quickly 
get out of hand as did the highway trust 
fund, and could become little more than a 
means of subsidizing the energy industry 
out of the public coffers. Sooner or later, 
the environmental costs of such easy an­
swers will come due-in the form of hazards 
to public health, increased pollution, low 
rates of return on the remaining public re­
sources, and reduced options in an uncer­
tain future. 

If price increases are necessary to moder­
ate demand, moneys from such increases 
need not filter into the pockets of industry. 
Taxes well programmed into current eco­
nomic realities, such as a Btu tax on all 
energy, excess profits taxes, or a gasoline 
tax, can be designed to filter dollars into 
programs that will further moderate de­
mand, such as subsidies to mass transit and 
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public-service employment to effect such 
changes as the insulation of older homes. 
Energy-tax revenues can be rebated to the 
public on a per-capita basis to ameliorate 
whatever regressive features may be built 
into the taxes. Inflation is an important, 
economy-wide problem, but it cannot be 
solved by abandoning needed environmental 

WASHINGTON REPORT 

and consumer reforms. Both interests can 
begin to work together to discover and 
attack some of its root causes. Environ­
mentalists cannot afford to ignore the social 
and economic context in which needed 
changes must take place; consumers cannot 
afford to ignore the future for the sake of an 
easier present. Eugene V. Coan 

Brock Evans 

Western Coal and Washington Politics 

T HE FIRST DA y OF SPRING was "COAL 
DAY" at the White House, an occasion 

when the Ford Administration offered hom­
age to leaders of the coal industry. Nearly 
all of the important representatives of the 
Administration were there. "There's no 
more important group in this country," said 
then Secretary of the Interior Rogers Mor­
ton. "I beg you to come in and talk to us and 
tell us what your problems are. Only if we 
have the input of business will we make the 
correct decision," said Secretary of Trans­
portation William T. Coleman, Jr. 

The industry men allowed that they might 
be interested in helping out the country with 
more coal production-provided certain 
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conditions were met, of course, including a 
wholesale relaxation of Clean Air Act stan­
dards and deadlines, a veto of strip-mine 
legislation, a relaxation of mine safety stan­
dards, limitations on preparation of environ­
mental impact statements, and federal sub­
sidies. "We realize that risk is part of the free 
enterprise system," said Ralph Bailey, presi­
dent of Consolidation Coal Company. Even 
so, he said the depletion allowance for coal 
should be increased from 10 percent to 15 
percent and the investment tax credit should 
be increased. 

We know from meetings like this and from 
its legislative program where the Ford Ad­
ministration stands on Energy Policy. In his 
energy message at the beginning of this 
year's session of Congress, President Ford 
announced his program, which has subse­
quently been introduced for full considera­
tion by the Congress. It includes a large­
scale expansion of nuclear plants and off­
shore oil leasing; a relaxation of Clean Air 
Act standards to permit the burning of dirty 
coal; weak strip-mine-control legislation ; 
some conservation measures, and a great in­
crease in the price of imported oil, to set a 
"price floor" which then, hopefully would 
stimulate the development of much more 
expensive synthetic fossil fuels in the West. 

There is not a great deal in common be­
tween the Administration program and that 
of the Sierra Club. Ours involves not just a 
heavy emphasis on mandatory conservation 
measures, such as improved gas mileage and 
building insulation standards, but also so­
phisticated and careful use of taxes and reg­
ulatory measures to make certain that the 
energy industry receives no subsidies, and 
that energy is priced at its "true cost." We 
favor mass-transit systems instead of high­
ways, emphasis on solar and wind-power 
research rather than nuclear, and smaller 
cars. As for increasing the supply of energy 
from traditional sources, we place heavy 
emphasis on deep-mined coal-there is a 
100-year supply of low sulfur coal east of 
the Mississippi that can only be deep­
mined. The methane gas in such mines, for­
merly thought of as waste, can be tapped to 
nearly double our natural-gas production. 
We favor strict regulation offurther offshore 

oil development and stripmuung; and of 
course, support a strong Clean Air Act. 

But where does Congress stand? So far, 
we don't know, but there has been a tremen­
dous flurry of activity over the President's 
Energy Message. For weeks, the published 
notices of hearings on energy subjects have 
been literally black with small print. There 
are simply too many of them for the five 
Sierra Club lobbyists in Washington to pos­
sibly attend. We cannot have an impact on 
all of them. So we have tried to be selective, 
concentrating on the two broadest phases of 
our main concern: protection of the environ­
ment from the problems of energy produc­
tion and establishment of new policies to 
direct future public and private energy in­
vestments. So far, we are doing reasonably 
well in the first category, but the picture is 
unclear in the second. 

On the plus side of the protection cate­
gory, Congress has finally passed a strip­
mine bill which, although weakened some­
what from last year's, still will be a good 
start at regulating this terribly destructive 
practice. President Ford, acting on behalf of 
the coal industry once again, is expected to 
veto the bill. But there should be enough 
votes this time to override it. Environmental­
ists are also busy working on legislation to 
regulate and control the pace and impact of 
offshore oil leasing and drilling. This legis­
lation has the strong support of many of the 
senators from the coastal states, and ought 
to pass in reasonable form this year. Hear­
ings on proposed extensions of the Clean 
Air Act have been taking place for several 
months now, and the strong indication from 
both House and Senate committees is that 
there will be little or no weakening of their 
standards, despite strong attacks from the 
Administration and from various industries. 

The situation is still not too good in the 
research field, since over 70 percent of the 
Administration's proposed budget for the 
Energy Research and Development Admin­
istration is related to various applications of 
nuclear energy. Substantial increases are 
proposed for solar power, conservation 
measures, and others of environmental im-

Colorado's governor, Richard Lamm, has 
praised Richard Bradley's The Cost of Urban 
Growth: Observations and Judgments as 
"· . . one of the most informative and read­
able studies I have seen in this area, and 
any municipality Ignores its message at its 
own peril." 
For your copy send $2.00 to Pikes Peak Area 
Council of Governments, 27 East Vermijo, 
Colorado Springs, Colorado 80903. 
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portance, but the imbalance is extremely 
great. 

Just as problematical is another bill, the 
Energy Conservation and Conversion Act 
of 1975, which is now being processed 
through the House Ways and Means Com• 
mittee. The bill has a number of complicated 
provisions, including taxing automobiles 
according to fuel economy, windfall profits 
and domestic oil and gas production, and 
taxes designed to save gasoline, as examples 
of some of the conservation measures pro­
posed. For environmentalists, one of the 
biggest problems with the bill is that it also 
creates an "energy trust fund," which can 
grow to about $10 billion before 1984. The 
trust fund would be used for a number of 
purposes, including research programs for 
new energy technologies, and for buses and 
mass transit. Unfortunately, major portions 
of the bill also provide for trust funds to be 
used for such environmentally destructive 
and high-cost energy technologies as oil 
shale, and coal and gas Liquefaction, which 
will have a tremendous impact on the agri­
cultural lands of the West. An unfortunate 
feature of the bill provides for "price guar­
antees" on long-term purchase contracts for 
other new energy sources-just about the 
same as President Ford's "price floor" pro­
gram to subsidize expensive oil shale de­
velopment. 

Our past experience with other trust 
funds, such as the Highway Trust Fund, 
makes us wary of this one. Regardless of all 
the other provisions of the legislation, a 
powerful lobby of oil companies and utili­
ties is sure to be formed-just Like the Good 
Roads Association with the Highway Trust 
Fund-to make certain that a vast bulk of 
the money is spent in subsidizing their ex­
pensive energy development in the West, 
rather than on cleaner technologies or on 
conservation measures. This bill is heavily 
opposed by elements within the Administra­
tion, and other interests, for a variety of rea­
sons. Its prognosis is unclear at this time. 
But it demonstrates, along with the other 
bills mentioned, the strong efforts to be made 
in Congress now to grapple with the energy 
situation. • 
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EDITORIAL 

Agriculture, Environment, 
and the Sierra Club 

Kent Gill 

A GRICULTURE HAS LONG been the dominant activity in the human use of land. Therefore, 
.l'1. agricultural practices and policies are significant determinants in how the land base is 
going to be treated. Yet the Sierra Club has never developed a comprehensive policy relating 
to agriculture. Instead, some specific club decisions on water projects, pesticides, predators, 
and planning have impinged unevenly upon our attitude toward farm and range operation. 

The Northern Plains Regional Conservation Committee (NPRCC) has forcefully called 
the problem to the attention of the national club. At a meeting held on the high plains of 
Wyoming and Montana, Sierra Club leaders and ranching interests, faced with the massive 
development of the coal resource by big energy companies and with the destruction of a way 
of life, began to identify a community of interest. However, the absence of an agricultural 
policy made it difficult for the Sierra Club units there to be guided in forging alliances. The 
NPRCC moved into the vacuum and drafted an interim policy statement addressed to the 
particular issues in that geographic region. 

As the statement was distributed among club leaders, constructive criticism began to 
develop. Some critics of the statement found inconsistencies with other club positions; others 
noted that the policy was applicable principally to Northern Plains problems; still others 
took issue with some of the planks. At the May meeting of the Sierra Club board of directors, 
the need for an agricultural policy was discussed and widely accepted; the Northern Plains 
people had served the club well by initiating this important dialogue. The board made plans 
for the early initiation of a policy project which would involve many Sierra Club members 
and units, which would seek both technical and philosophical contributions, and which 
would result in the preparation of a comprehensive agricultural policy broadly applicable 
to the club's stance toward the nation's food-and-fiber production. 

The dimensions of such a policy are interesting to consider. For instance, it must tackle 
the question of how important are agricultural enterprises in comparison with competitive 
uses-industry or urban development or recreation or wilderness. It must provide us with 
a way to judge when agriculture must be an exclusive use of land and when a given area can 
accommodate multiple compatible uses, including agriculture. It has to address such basic 
economic issues as corporate farming (in contrast to the hallowed family farm), tax policy 
as it affects agricultural use of land, and public subsidy. 

Some fundamental ecological considerations must be studied. The following questions 
might be raised: 

In a human time scale, is soil a destructible or a renewable resource? 
Can the larger ecosystem tolerate the water demands of intensive, irrigated agricul­

ture? 
How do agricultural chemicals affect the native plants and animals-and soil 

longevity, as well? 
The energy efficiency of agriculture will become an issue, the question being whether in 

an energy-short world the caloric productivity of agriculture will exceed the required energy 
input by some responsible amount. Soil conservation will have to be viewed more broadly 
than only the retention of physical volume, by inquiring as well into maintaining the chemical 
viability of the soil to act as an energy interceptor. 

Then thorny problems of range management, land-planning policies, predator control, 
and water diversion will have to be addressed in terms of Sierra Club principles. 

Because the Sierra Club does operate from a set of basic precepts, we can predict that 
the final policy will reflect a concern for the natural scene: for protection of native species 
and natural ecosystems. The policy undoubtedly will define how much agricultural manip­
ulation can be tolerated in which areas. It will most likely call for the fullest possible knowl­
edge for decision-making, including broad analyses of environmental impacts by all applic­
able sciences. We will probably want to speak to the limits of technology, questioning whether 
technology can solve all the problems, including those it creates, doubting that artificial 
systems have the built-in balances of natural ones. And Sierra Club policy will hopefully 
take the long view, projecting past the 20th century to future centuries and millennia. 
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Southwest: Coal Gasification 

AT ONE TIME it looked as if the first opera­
n. tional, large-scale coal gasification 
plants in the United States would be located 
on the Navajo Indian Reservation in north­
western New Mexico. That optimistic pro­
jection is somewhat in doubt, although inter­
est in the proposals is still very much alive. 
Two companies have plans for plants in this 
area. The Western Gasification Company 
(WESCO) plans call for the initial plant, 
producing 250 million cubic feet per day 
(MMCFD) of substitute natural gas (SNG ), 
to be in operation in 1978. The addition of 
three similar plants by WESCO would bring 
their production to 1,000 MMCFD by 1983. 
Coal for the plants wiU come from a nearby. 
strip mine to be operated by Utah Interna­
tional, which also holds the necessary water 
rights. The Federal Power Commission 
(FPC) has just recently authorized WESCO 
to mix the SNG with natural gas in existing 
pipelines. The biggest remaining obstacle 
facing WESCO is the approval by the Na­
vajo nation of the lease for the plant sites 
themselves, plus rights-of-way. 

A similar timetable had been projected by 
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El Paso Natural Gas Company (El Paso) 
for their two complexes to be located a few 
miles south of WESCO's plants. The first, 
producing 288 MMCFD, was to have be­
come operational in 1978. The addition of 
a second complex and expansion of both 
would have increased El Paso's output to 
785 MMCFD in 1981. In addition to the 
Navajo tribal approvals similar to those 
sought by WESCO, El Paso needs permis­
sion of the FPC, and Congressional approval 
of their use of San Juan River water. 

The projects would primarily serve cus­
tomers in Arizona, Nevada and California, 
although Midwestern customers could also 
expect some benefits from an increased gas 
supply. To place this in the proper perspec­
tive, the ultimate output (1,785 MMCFD) 
of the two companies' plants combined 
would supply about 2.5 percent of the cur­
rent demand for natural gas in the United 
States. 

The schedules for both WESCO and El 
Paso seem hopelessly optimistic, although 
WESCO is clearly in the better position. The 
Navajo nation is deeply divided on the issue 
and negotiations with the tribe are likely to 
be protracted. Navajos living on and near 
the sites of the proposed plants and strip 
mines are overwhelmingly opposed to them. 
On three occasions, members of the Bur­
ham Chapter of the Navajo nation have been 
asked to approve the proposed projects and 
each time they have rejected them. The most 
recent vote on April 18 was 114 to 14 against 
the projects. Although the Navajo Tribal 
Council is not legally bound by this vote, 
they are verr reluctant to go against the 
wishes of the local residents. Still there is 
strong interest among the Navajo tribal 
leadership in proceeding with the projects. 
The proponents see development of the 
tribe's mineral resources, including coal, as 
one of the more hopeful means of providing 
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jobs on the reservation where unemployment 
exceeds 50 percent. Moderates among the 
Navajo suggest that some development 
might be permissible, but only if done on a 
smaller scale and if owned and managed by 
the tribe. 

What can we expect if the projects are 
built? To some, the region is a sparsely pop­
ulated desert already blighted by the notori­
ous Four Corners power plant and strip 
mine located a few mil.es to the north. To 
Burham Chapter residents, it is the only 
home they have ever known, and it is un­
likely that all these people, many of whom 
have little formal education, could find em­
ployment in the plants. 

The draft environmental impact state­
ments on the projects, prepared by the Bu­
reau of Reclamation, estimate that the plants 
will bring an additional 40,000 people to the 
area. WESCO and El Paso financed a study 
of possible new towns to house the workers 
and their families, but little has been done in 
the way of implementing the study. In view 
of the lack of housing and community ser­
vices, one wonders if the people needed to 
build and operate the plants could be at­
tracted to the area. 

This flood of new people would almost 
surely completely destroy the culture and 
life-style of the local residents. It would 
likely include a sizable non-Navajo popula­
tion, since not enough trained Navajo would 
be available within the compressed time­
tables of the gasification companies. 

Much concern has been expressed over the 
socioeconomic stresses that can be expected 
from these projects, but few have seriously 
considered what will happen when the coal 
is gone and the plants are shut down. What 
will support the region's population then? 
Questions have also been raised about the 
use of water by the coal gasification plants. 
WESCO and El Paso say they will need a 
total of 61,500 acre-feet of water from the 
already overcommitted flow of the San Juan 
River. Some worry that the actual need will 
be greater than that, but in any event, use of 
water for gasification could infringe on the 
amount available for the Navajo Indian irri­
gation project. 
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The many problems, plus a shortage of 
construction capital, seem to have discour­
aged El Paso from trying to meet their earlier 
projected timetable. They have asked the 
FPC to defer action on their application. 
Although company officials deny they have 
abandoned the projects, it seems increasingly 
clear that they have lost interest in it, at least 
for the short term. 

The Navajo face one of their most crucial 
decisions. Are the employment and eco­
nomic benefits worth the cost, and if so, how 
can the problems be minimized? U some de­
velopment is to proceed, then the manifold 
problems would seem to argue that it be 
stretched out over a much longer period of 
time. This would extend the life of the coal­
based economy, tend to reduce the socio­
economic stresses resulting from boom-type 
growth, and provide an opportunity to learn 
from earlier mistakes. 'ln the last analysis, it 
is a decision that should be made by the 
Navajo people themselves, hopefully with­
out undue influence by energy companies, 
bureaucrats, or well-meaning outsiders. In­
creased awareness among the Navajo gives 
us some hope that it will be a well-informed 
and carefully considered decision. 

Joh11 McComb 

BEQUESTS, TRUSTS, 
AND MEMORIALS 

THE CLUB would like to remind its 
members and friends that be­

quests to the Club can contribute im­
measurably to the support of our 
work through the years. Our tax at­
torneys will be glad to consult with 
you and your legal adviser as to the 
best method of framing your will in 
order to serve your interests and meet 
the Club's needs. This includes advice 
on the use of trusts and insurance 
policies to benefit Club programs 
through one of our two related tax­
deductible organizations. 

U you desire information, please 
contact the Executive Director at 1050 
Mills Tower, San Francisco, CA 
94104. 

It may also be useful to remind you 
that memorial and other gifts are fre­
quently made to assist our program. 
These are carefully acknowledged to 
the family of the person so remem­
bered. 

CO-OP WILDERNESS SUPPLY 
Quality backpacking equipment at the low­
est possible prices. Send 25¢ for 48 pg. 
catalog to: 

Co-op Wilderness Supply 
1432 University Avenue 

Berkeley, CA 94702 @ 
or visit us at our Berkeley or 
Castro Valley retail locations. 

FROM THE EDITOR 

The Bulletin Looks Ahead 

W E ARE VERY PLEASED to announce that, beginning with this issue, the Bulletin will 
have both a new editor and a new managing editor. Stephen Whitney, the managing 

editor, has been working with the Bulletin almost three years, and his promotion is well 
deserved. I am new to the Sierra Club and am delighted to be here. For years I have been 
writing about urgent environmental concerns for various magazines and audiences, and, 
while there was much avowed interest, I was often discouraged by the obvious lack of 
commitment of my readers. So now, it is with a comforting sense of relief and anticipation 
that I come to the Sierra Club and I am looking forward to being a working part of this 
vital organization. 

The Bulletin is the only publication the club sends regularly to all its members-plus 
thousands of other people who are interested in conservation-and therefore it is in a 
unique position to provide a nationwide forum for discussion and exchange of information 
among all of us. Making sure that everyone knows what is happening-the problems and 
also the solutions as they become clear-is necessary for any organization deyoted to action. 
Knowing the facts is the key to successful action, and in these pages we have the perfect 
place to nourish what is already coming to be a national network of involved and knowl­
edgeable people. This is why the Bulletin is important: it provides a forum in which we can 
all talk with one another. 

I would like to mention here some of the plans Steve and I have for the coming months, 
but in doing so, I must also stress-albeit briefly-that the Bulletin, like most other pub­
lications, is feeling the effects of the current recession. Advertising and other revenues are 
down; costs are up. So, even as we try to expand the magazine, we must also save money­
a neat trick, at best. We hope you will not only bear with us, but encourage us, as we con­
tinue to experiment with different paper stocks and type faces, with alternating color and 
black-and-white issues, with size and frequency of publications-all in an attempt to get 
the most from what resources we have. 

Beginning in the fall, we will increase our coverage of chapter and membership news, 
especially those recent local problems that have been resolved successfully through chapter 
action. The power to make news or policies public, in order to influence what happens, 
must be made to work for us, as others make it work for them. For instance, it has been 
reported that the beverage industries spent $1 million on a successful publicity campaign 
in Dade County, Florida, convincing voters to defeat a deposit-bill referendum. The 
Bulletin, with nowhere near that amount of money, hopes to use more of its pages for our 
chapters to recount their experiences and what they have learned, so that our future efforts 
will be more swift and effective. 

In this regard, and in another, we want to hear from you. If, having read an article in 
the Bulletin, you find you have differing or additional information you would like to share 
with other club members, write us a letter-it does not have to be an article-and we will 
try to publish as many as we can. 

We intend to change the format of the Commentary section, not only to accommodate 
the above changes, but to allow us to publish more conservation news, both from inside 
and out of the club. We also plan to give space to brief reviews of newly published books 
we think will be of interest to our audience. We probably will not devote much space to any 
one book, but, instead, will try to present a broad sample of the various new books on 
nature and environmental concerns. 

In addition, related articles will be presented together, like the two on East Africa 
published in this issue; we are also considering for our schedule each year, the publication 
of one "special" issue on an outstanding and timely subject. In February, for example, we 
hope to publish a complete issue on the wilderness-our part in the nation's Bicentennial 
celebration. 

And, of course, we will continue to publish articles about interesting places and trips 
into the wilderness, along with the many beautiful photographs and illustrations that en­
hance the magazine. 

Last, I want to emphasize again that the Bulletin intends to be part of the entire Sierra 
Club process, and I, too, will work with the chapters and members, not only with the staff 
members here in the offices. So, if you have any comments about the magazine, if you have 
any suggestions, please do send them. I'll be glad to hear from you. Frances Gendlin 
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REGIONAL REPS REPORT 

Southern California: Atoms for L.A. 

ENERGY IsruF.s continue to dominate con­
servation work in Southern California. 

Drilling for offshore oil, building superports 
and liquefied natural gas terminals, and im­
porting electricity from new coal-fired plants 
in Nevada and Utah are all being proposed. 
But at the top of the list as the super energy 
proposal is the San Joaquin Nuclear Project 
(SJNP). 

With the distinction of being the largest 
nuclear-fission project in this part of the 
world-only Japan is proposing a larger 
complex-the SJNP will take over 2,500 
acres of farm and grazing land near the small 
community of Wasco, 33 miles northwest of 
Bakersfield and 32 miles from California's 
infamous San Andreas earthquake fault. 

Here in the San Joaquin Valley, which is 
some of the nation's richest farmland, four 
1,300-megawatt reactors will rise above the 
flatland to jointly produce 5,200 megawatts 
of power. And cooling towers 150 feet tall 
will dominate the scene as they spew forth 
water vapor from the 100,000 annual acre­
feet of waterneeded to cool the four reactors. 

This gargantuan project is being directed 
by the Los Angeles Department of Water 
and Power (DWP) which will reap nearly 45 
percent of the electricity produced. Other 
participants include Southern California 
Edison, Pacific Gas and Electric, other mu­
nicipalities, in addition to the California 
Department of Water Resources, which 
wants more power to pump more water 
south. Consequently, the project has been 
called a statewide endeavor, even though the 
residents of Kern County where the reactors 
will be located can think of it only as an­
other power grab by powerful and power-

A HOUSE FOR SALE 
uthentic Brick Center Hall Colo­

nial, circa 1795, with 85 Forested 
Acres. 
Built in conformity with its habitat: 
Granite foundation, full cemented cel­
lar, large rooms, 12 over 12 windows, 
deep set sills, walls three bricks thick, 
random width pine floors, wainscot­
ing, four working fireplaces with twin 
chimneys on granite slab cantilever 
constructed foundations. 
All utilities and conveniences plus 
large cast iron coal kitchen range with 
several years supply of coal on hand. 
250 miles north of New York City, 
AMTRAK service nearby, minutes 
from Interstate System, ski areas and 
lakes. 
Sacrifice at $85,000. Call Bill Lane at 
(212) 964-0400 or write Box 52, Rose­
bank Station, Staten Island, N.Y. 
10305. 
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hungry Los Angeles. Local opposition to 
having Los Angeles' nuke as a neighbor has 
been best expressed by the stickers that 
adorn bumpers in Kern County, reading 
simply: "Stick it in LA." 

Kern County's opposition has many fac­
ets : well-founded fears about the dangers of 
nuclear power; anger at being forced to ac­
cept all the risks when Los Angeles will reap 
most of the benefits; frustration over its lack 
of power to affect decision-making on the 
project; uneasiness about a nuke in earth­
quake country. But the overriding local con­
cern thus far has focused on these plants' 
voracious thirst for water. 

In an area where water is scarce and agri­
culture is king, the farmers are upset about 
the new competition for water this project 
poses, especially for this much water. In fact, 
Senator Howard Way, chairman of the 
State Senate Committee on Food and Agri­
culture, has taken a public stand against lo­
cating any nuclear power plant in the interior 
of California when agricultural water would 
be used as the plant's coolant. 

Beyond the project's 100,000-acre-feet­
per-year thirst, the farmers have other wor­
ries. One concern is what impact all this 
water vapor will have on weather and con­
sequent vegetation growth in the valley, 
where severe temperature inversions already 
account for long-lasting tule fogs. 

Wasco farmer Jim Neufeld has talked 
about another fear: "If at any time a small 
leak of radioactive material occurred at the 
plant, no matter how insignificant, the pub­
licity would be bad, lowering the value of the 
crops. There's no advantage from an agri­
cultural standpoint in having the plant in the 
Wasco area, as opposed to someplace else. 
It's against agriculture and this is agricul­
tural land. We're the second county .in the 
nation in agricultural production, after 
Fresno," he has said, "and we are aiming to 
be number one." 
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Even without an accident or leak at the 
reactors, however, the project will remove 
considerable acreage of farmland from pro­
duction. A group of farmers opposing the 
project have estimated that this loss of crop 
production could amount to $188 million a 
year. 

From the beginning, the Sierra Club of 
course has spoken out against this project 
because of our standing policy opposing the 
licensing, construction and operation of new 
nuclear reactors pending the resolution of 
the significant safety problems inherent in 
reactor operation, disposal of spent fuel, 
and possible diversion of nuclear material 
capable of use in weapons manufacture. 

In addition, we have repeatedly ques­
tioned whether the Los Angeles Department 
of Water and Power was proceeding on this 
project without regard to the California En­
vironmental Quality Act. In particular, we 
asked how DWP could award substantial 
contracts before completing an environ­
mental-impact report as required by state 
law. Finally, but only after California At­
torney General Evelle Younger warned 
against proceeding without an impact re­
port, DWP management backed down and 
consented to the report, which was released 
late in April. 

Meanwhile, the Sierra Club, along with 
other citizen groups, has focused on the eco­
nomics of the project and come up with some 
startling facts. Most important: in less than 
a year, the construction costs for the project 
have risen from $2 billion to $4.8 billion, 
even though the original estimate took infla­
tion into account. Certainly, we have said, 
the Los Angeles DWP, which claims to be 
building this nuclear project to save its rate­
payers money, owes the ratepayer an expla­
nation of why costs have more than doubled, 
especially when the original figures included 
escalation costs. More to the point, we have 
asked how DWP can claim to be saving its 
ratepayers $50 million a year by building 
this project when the cost of the project has 
risen $2.8 billion in ten months! 

Furthermore, we have pointed out that 
this $4.8-billion cost figure accounts only for 
construction and does not include the costs 
of nuclear fuel, cooling water, transmission 
facilities and operation and maintenance. 
According to our analysis, fuel costs over 
the lifetime of the reactors may raise the 
price oftheSJNPto over $12 billion. 

After revealing the results of our investi­
gation on May 6, we called upon Los Angeles 
Mayor Tom Bradley to initiate an indepen-

GRAND SOUTHWEST SAFARIS: Air tours 
of New Mexico, Colorado, Utah and Arl­
zon a. Camping, hiking, riding, rafting. 
Geology, Archaeology, Ecology, History. 
Visit the Grand Canyon, Indian villages, 
Anasazl cliff dwellings, remote trading 
posts. 1-15 day expeditions. Free brochure: 
Southwest Safaris, Dept. SC, Box 945, 
Santa Fe, N.M. 87501. 
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dent review of the DWP economic reports 
on the project. Also, because utilities 
throughout California are involved in the 
project and the economic questions we 
raised have statewide implications, we sent 
our analysis to Governor Edmund G. 
Brown, Jr., California's new Energy and 
Resources Development Commission, and 
the State Public Utilities Commission. Our 
criticisms are sure to provide some lively 
debate on the true costs of nuclear power 
generation. 

Another related public debate, which 
promises to be even hotter and more com­
plicated, started the same day we released 
our economic study. It centers on the nuclear 
safeguards initiative, which the Sierra Club 
supports and which nearly 500,000 people in 
California signed to qualify it for the June 
1976 ballot. After one year, this initiative 
would prohibit nuclear power-plant con­
struction and prohibit operation of existing 
plants at more than 60 percent of original 
licensed core-power level unless federal 
liability limits are removed. After five years, 
the initiative requires the derating of existing 
plants by ten percent each year unless the 
legislature, by two-thirds vote, bas con­
firmed effectiveness of safety systems and 
waste-disposal methods. 

Opposition to the initiative is being led by 
former Governor Pat Brown, Sr., and his 
Citizens for Jobs & Energy. These "citizens" 
include Robert Phillips, recently retired gen­
eral manager of Los Angeles' Department 
of Water and Power, Howard Allen, vice­
president of Southern California Edison, 
and Norman Houston, chairman of Golden 
State Life Insurance. 

We think the voters have the right toques­
tion, through this initiative, the claims of the 
nuclear industry and the utilities. But 
whether or not the voter gets that chance will 
depend on whether we can articulate, over 
the cacophony and confusion the opposition 
will surely create, the basics of our concern 
over nuclear power. At least we have a year 
to try. Mary Ami Eriksen 

THE ADVENTURE OF 10 LIFETIMES! 
Run the Omo and Blue Nile through the 
high mountains of Ethiopia! More than 
350 miles of just-discovered river . . . 
rapids as rousing as the Colorado's ... 
through mountains, desert and jungle. 
Wild (but unhostile) tribes. Big game and 
birds by the hundreds. 2 to 4 weeks ... 
trips scheduled between September and 
February ... prices from $665 to $1500 
plus airfare. By the outfitter famous for 
hundreds of safe rowing expeditions down 
the Colorado: 
O.A.R.S., lnc./SOBEK EXPEDITIONS, P.O. 
Box 67, Angels Camp, Calif. 95222. Write 
or call right away! Phone (209) 736-2924. 

NEWS VIEW 

Board elects club officers 
at annual organization meeting 

T HE SIERRA CLUB board of directors held 
its annual meeting May 4-5 in San Fran­

cisco. Officers for the coming year were 
elected as follows: President, Kent Gill; 
Vice-President, Ted Snyder; Secretary, Wil­
liam Futrell; Treasurer, Paul Swatek; Fifth 
Officer, Holway Jones. In addition, Joseph 
Fontaine was selected by the board as its 
fifteenth member. Fontaine replaces Claire 
Dedrick, who resigned last February to be­
come California Resources Secretary. For­
merly Southern California regional conser­
vation committee chairman, Fontaine lives 
in Tehachapi, California, where be teaches 
high school science. 

The conservation agenda included four 
items which the board discussed and acted 
upon: 

FERAL BURRO POLICY: Feral burros, 
currently protected by federal legislation 
passed in 1971, pose an increasingly alarm- · 
ing problem in the Southwest, including 
Southern California, by destroying habitat 
and competing with native wildlife. In re-

sponse to this situation, the board adopted 
policy as follows: 

The Sierra Club calls for the control of 
feral burros in a manner which protects 
native flora, fauna and soils. In addi­
tion, the Sierra Club adopts as sug­
gested guidelines for this policy the 
"Sierra Club Feral Burro Management 
Policy" prepared by the SCRCC Desert 
Subcommittee and the Wildlife Sub­
committee of the Angeles Chapter. 

Containing 13 specific recommendations 
for burro management and ecosystem pro­
tection, the policy calls for humane treat­
ment of these feral animals while acknowl­
edging the need to remove them from 
national parks and monuments as well as 
from all public lands where they are degrad­
ing habitats in which endangered or threat­
ened species offlora and fauna e_xist. 

HUNTING POLICY: The board decided 
that no change was needed in the club's ex­
isting policy on hunting-a provision in 

Bicycle Softwear 

We are a small manufacturer of a vari­
ety of bags which ordinarily attach to 
bikes but will also attach to you. Profes­
sional bikepeople use them when cross­
countrying, but also for -shopping and 
picnicking. Their kids use them for 
books and sweaters whether walking or 
biking. Some designs make nice hand­
bags; some convert to bonafide back­
packs. Other manufacturers make 
similar bags; our claim to bikeland fame 
is that we were first, and our products 
have stood up terrifically well. You can 
ask around about us, or send the cou-

pon; we'll send you a free catalog and 
tell you which stores carry our line. 
Thank you. 

Bicycle Softwear, made by Bellwether, 
San Francisco 

To: Bellwether, 
1161 Mission St.,San Francisco 

Please send a free catalog and the names of 
stores near me where 1 can see your line. 
Name ___________ _ 

Addr<=-------,-------
City tate ip __ 
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current wildlife policy which accepts well­
regulated periodic hunting, among others, 
as a management technique. The National 
Wilderness Committee had urged a resolu­
tion which would have had the club accept 
"provisions in basic laws that recognize 
hunting as a legitimate use of wilderness 
areas of the national forests and other appro­
priate public lands." 

AGRICULTURAL POLICY: A regional 
agricultural policy drafted by the Northern 
Plains RCC pointed to the need for the club 
to adopt a broad agricultural policy which 
would encompass national goals and present 
guidelines to groups who wished to make 
regional policies on agriculture. To this end 
it was decided that a task force would ~ 
established which would receive input from 
the relevant club entities and individuals 
with expertise and interest in the various 
areas involved. Discussion ofa national agri­
cultural policy is anticipated at the Labor 
Day meeting of the board, and consideration 
of a formal statement is expected in October. 

PET 4: At its meeting in March 1975 
the club's executive committee pa~sed ~ 
resolution cautioning against hurried mar­
keting of oil from the Elk Hills Naval Petro­
leum Reserve and against oil production 
from Petroleum Reserve 4 on Alaska's 
North Slope. At the recent annual meeting 
the board reaffir,med that policy and added 
to it a further statement with regard to 
"Pet 4": · 

The Sierra Club believes that oil re­
sources within Naval Petroleum Re­
serve 4 in Alaska should be held in 
reserve for possible future use and that 
immediate emphasis should be placed 
on conducting basic environmental 
studies of the area's surface resources. 
These studies should lead to prepara­
tion of a comprehensive land-manage-

ARE YOU MOVING? 
We need to know 4 weeks In all­
¥8" If Ware to insure that your 
aaxt fluUetin will reach you soon 
.,._,..,. mail ft. Please attach the 
label from the back of this lsswe, 
te tfle spot below, and enter your 
new address. 
r----------------------, 
I I 
• I J I 
~ I 

r I 
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:Selldte~Slerra Club M111ber Services 
!20Busflst. 
San Frllldsco, calf. 94104 
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ment plan which would identify areas of 
critical environmental concern, such as 
caribou and waterfowl habitat and 
areas used by Alaskan natives for sub­
sistence. The plan should protect these 
areas and allow further oil and gas ex­
ploration only in places where explora­
tion and development would be com­
patible with protection of surface re­
sources. The club urges that adminis­
tration of the surface resources be im­
mediately vested in the U.S. Fish and 
Wildlife Service, with key areas such as 
the Utukok (caribou calving ground) 
and Teshukpuk (waterfowl habitat) to 
be placed in wildlife refuges. 

The Japanese may request 
permission to hunt the 
protected gray whale 

Recent reports indicate that the Japanese 
government will request permission from the 
InternationalWhalingCommission(I.W.C.) 
to ~esume "harvesting" of the gray whale, 
which has been protected by international 
treaty since 1947. It is further rumored that 
a Japanese firm operating out of Los An­
geles has approached the Mexican govern­
ment with a request to take grays in Mexican 
waters, where they go to breed. 

The I.W.C. convenes in London on June 
23. If the above rumors are true, it would be 
too late then to do much about them. Since 
there is good reason to believe they are true 
it is important that those concerned about 
the gray whale express themselves now 
while there is still time to act. The gray whal; 
can be saved. Letters insisting on continued 
protection for the gray whale should be sent 
to: R. Stacey, Secretary, International Whal­
ing Commission, Great Westminster House 
Horseferry Road, London, S.W. I, England'. 
You should also write to: Dr. Robert White, 
U.S. Commissioner, International Whaling 
Commission, National Oceanic and Atmos­
pheric Administration, Rockville, Maryland 
20852. 

Auto makers relax 
emission-control efforts 

A report prepared for the Environmental 
Protection Agency (EPA) demonstrates 
that U.S. automobile manufacturers have 
virtually ceased all efforts to develop the 
technology necessary to comply with 1978 
auto-emission standards for at least one 
major pollutant, oxides of nitrogen (NOx). 
The report, "Auto Emission Control: the 
Technical Status and Outlook," was cited 
by EPA admin.istrator Russell Train in a 
March decision granting auto makers more 
time to comply with hydrocarbon and car­
bon monoxide standards. But Train did not 
reveal at that time that the report presents a 
devastating indictment of the efforts by U.S. 

auto makers to meet the 0.4-grams-per-mile 
limit on emissions of NOx, a limit tlfat has 
been contained in federal law since 1970 
and which they are legally required to mee~ 
by 1978. 

The EPA scientists told Train in the re­
Continued on page 38 

New Crisis in the Redwoods 

Devastating clear-cut logging con­
tinues around the periphery of Red­
wood National Park in northern Cali­
fornia, even as evidence mounts that 
such logging threatens the survival of 
major portions of the park, including 
the Tall Trees Grove. Recognizing the 
extremely critical situation, Congress­
men Phillip Burton and John Burton 
Uoined by 20 congressmen represent­
ing almost as many states and terri­
tories) have introduced legislation to 
gain the protection that is essential for 
the future of the Redwood National 
Park and its irreplaceable resources. 
H.R. 5193 would add approximately 
73,500 acres to the present park. 
About 12,600 acres of this addition is 
old-growth forest. This fragmented 
old-growth acreage is all that remains 
in the Redwood Creek drainage 
around the present park. 

The redwood industry has now 
nearly exhausted its resource of old­
growth redwoods through excessive 
cutting on privately owned lands. If 
present trends continue, the old­
growth industry will come to an end 
within 10 to 15 years and the Red­
wood Region will be faced with drastic 
changes in its economy. The industry 
is launching an all-out propaganda 
drive (reported to cost a half-million 
dollars) apparently to place the blame 
for this on the conservationists and 
the achievement of a Redwood Na­
tional Park. Scare-tactic publications 
are flooding the Redwood Region 
and Congress to prevent any expan­
sion of the park. Pressures to exempt 
logging from coverage by California's 
Environmental Quality Act are 
mounting in Sacramento. Anti-park 
sentiment from Redwood Region 
citizens (who recently felled two giant 
trees in the Ladybird Johnson Grove 
of the Redwood National Park) is be­
ing felt strongly in Washington, D.C. 
In turn, conservationists are launch­
ing a new campaign to assure the per­
petuation of the great redwood3 
along with a broader economic bas~ 
for the beleaguered single-industry 
Redwood Region. National, all-out 
support for H.R. 5193 is a first and 
major step. 

Edgar Wayburn, M.D. 



The Annual Meetings 
- Past and Present 

T HE SIERRA CLUB'S annual organi­
zational meeting, held in the 

austere setting of San Francisco's First 
Unitarian Church, contrasted sharply 
with the first such meeting I attended 
back in 1966. It was not merely the 
luxury-vs.-hard times atmospheres. ft 
was something more-a contrast in 
spirit. Partisan politicking seemed 
more evident in the earlier proceed­
ings. There was drama and excite­
ment, of course, at that and other 
meetings in those days of the club's 
growing pains. Both have now been 
replaced by a new sense of responsi­
bility and purpose, leavened with a 
refreshing openness and good humor. 

The 1975 meeting was a working 
meeting of ~rtivist members from all 
parts of Nonh America and Hawaii. 

This by no means is intended to be a 
report of the 1975 proceedings. Your 
chapter's delegate to the Sierra Club 
Council will be reporting on those in 
your chapter newsletter. Full details 
of actions also will be available in the 
board and council minutes. I am 
limiting my "coverage" to a few sig­
nificant, I hope, observations. 

In Defense of ''Circuses" 

IT WAS A working meeting. Three 
days, not the usual two. A smorgas­

bord of workshops and committee 
meetings was served to council dele­
gates Friday afternoon and evening. 
More workshops and rap sessions 
went on at special Saturday and Sun­
day breakfasts. These extras not only 
promoted liaison among delegates 
from all over the continent, but pre­
pared them for more productive par­
ticipation in the business sessions. 

In the past, the club's weekend 
meetings have been called circuses, 
because so much was going on that no 
one possibly could watch all of the 
rings. The three-day schedule helps 
some. But no way is anyone able to 
attend meetings of the council and the 
executive committee of the board that 
are going on at the same time-as 
happened May 3rd. Some members 
have contended that such meetings 
are a waste of time and money. There 

used to be reason enough for such a 
judgment, and I always mumbled my 
assent to it. Now, however, I must 
voice my dissent. The May meeting 
convincingly demonstrated the value 
of face-to-face discussion in arriving 
at decisions that can keep the club on 
course. 

A Council Resurgent 

THE MOST DRAMATIC demonstra­
tion came on Saturday afternoon 

at the meeting of the council, which 
is largely responsible for club in­
ternal affairs. With the proliferation 
of chapters-now 46, to be 48 by 
July l with addition of the new 
DACOTAH (North and South Dakota) 
and WYOMING chapters-the council 
has become a bit unwieldy. It also is 
expensive to convene-with 48 per­
cent of the club's members and 35 of 
its chapters outside California. 

Under the Internal Organization 
Committee plan, the council's ex­
ecutive committee would be ex­
panded from five to nine members, 
meet at least twice a year, and be 
vested with the council's decision­
making authority. The full council 
would meet once a year, its delegates 
serving chiefly as information and 
education conduits between their in­
dividual chapters and the club. When 
the IOC presented that plan at an 
informal session Friday, there were a 
few questions on details. On the whole 
it seemed a sensible, well-thought-out 
proposal, one that would save money, 

and yet. ... By the next day some 
doubts began to surface. Then, at the 
council session, M urray Rosenthal 
of the ANGELES CHAPTER rose and 
gave voice to those doubts. In effect, 
he said, the council would become 
powerless and useless, and die. Meet­
ing only once a year, it could not even 
perform its liaison function. He main­
tained that, in spite of its bulk, the 
council did perform a valuable service 
by reflecting the interests of chapters 
and their members, that providing an 
open forum for the club was a high­
priority budget item, and that the IOC 
plan would tend to break the club 
apart into sectional satrapies. 

The upshot: After long and some­
times heated discussion, the council 
sent the report back to the IOC, in­
structing it to provide for at least three 
full council meetings a year and to 
maintain the full council's veto power 
over nonroutine executive committee 
decisions. 

And the Lesson 

T HE FIRST TANGIBLE result of the 
council's resurgence may have 

been the board of directors' later de­
cision to schedule a full council and 
board meeting in October in St.Louis. 
One certain result is that the council, 
by its own performance, clearly 
showed the club's real need for a vig­
orous forum, for a council that can act 
wisely and responsibly to assure the 
members and chapters an effective 
voice in the affairs of their club. 

BULLETIN BOARD 

Good-bye, Tower 

By about November 1, we 
are going to have to give up 
an old habit: calling club 
headquarters "the Tower." 
After eight years at 220 
Bush Street, in the heart of 
San Francisco's financial 
district, the Sierra Club will 
move up the street three 
blocks to number 530 on the 
edge of Chinatown. The 
building, a long-abandoned 
power substation, is now 
being remodeled. The new 

quarters will provide for the 
efficient operation of all de­
partments of the club under 
one roof. But what to call 
the new headquarters? 

People 

The HAWAII CHAPTER has 
established a memorial fund 
to help carry on the work of 
Geraldine Cline, 23, who 
died in an auto crash Febru­
ary 8, 1975. Geri had pio­
neered the chapter's service 
trip program for young peo­
ple. Interest from the fund 

will enable young Hawaiians 
to take part in the program. 
Gifts may be sent to the 
HAWAII CHAPTER office or to 
the Sierra Club Foundation, 
c/o Willis Moore, Bishop 
Museum, Honolulu 96818. 
Ken McCJaugherty of the 
LoNE STAR CHAPTER has a 
project going to put moun­
taineering and related books 
on tape for blind persons. 
He needs help-tapes, read­
ers, books, money. Write 
him at Box 496, Pleasanton, 
Texas 78064. 
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COST I NDEXING (Cont.Jrompage20) 

view process, th e AEC Environmental 
Project Manager (EP M) arrives from 
Washington, D.C., accompanied (or 
followed soon after) by AEC lawyers. 
They sit around th e conference table 
with th e team leader and go through 
the preliminary draft word by word. 
Occasionally, a team member who 
wrote a particular section is called 
in to clarify or justify some state­
ment. A treatise could be written on 
this particular period in the history 
of an impact statement; suffice it to say 
that the hot collars developed during 
the internal review process are noth­
ing compared to the heat engendered 
during discussions between scientists 
and lawyers. There are scientists who 
can talk to lawyers, and there are law­
yers who can talk to scientists. These 
are precious types and should be culti­
vated. But there are also scientists and 
lawyers who have no meeting ground 
except the floor they are standing on. 
The controversial point may simply 
be the use of the word "may" rather 
than "will," or it can be more sub­
stantial, such as whether or not the 
utility should be required to decrease 
its water-intake velocity. Quite often, 
the biologist overlooks the fact that 
any additional expense on the part of 
the utility will be passed on to the con­
sumer; on the other hand, the lawyer 
seems more concerned with fulfilling 
the letter of the law, rather than its 
intent. In either case, since the final 
document is a legal one, to be used in 
an adversary-type hearing, conducted 
by lawyers, the final decision on a con­
troversial point rests with the lawyers 
and the EPM. If the scientist w ish es 
to carry the argument higher up, he 
can refer the problem to the AEC 
branch chief, who, in my experience, 
is usually more flexible than the EPM. 
The arguments are given some con­
sideration by the branch chief, but be­
cause strong, supporting data are 
often lacking, he usually agrees with 
his EPM and the lawyers. The scien­
tist returns to his cubicle frustrated at 
the whole bureaucratic process and 
wonders why he was hired at all. 
"Let the lawyers write the state­
ments!!" Then he cools off and shud­
ders to think what would happen if 
lawyers did write the statements, and 
is thankful that he had some small in­
put. By th e time the draft environ­
mental statement (DES) is printed, the 
scientist is resigned to accepting that 
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green-covered document as his own, 
except for the radiological impact and 
accident sections (these are prepared 
at AEC headquarters). 

A 45-day period then follows, in 
which copies of the DES are sent to 
the utility, state and federal agencies, 
l ocal libraries, and interested groups 
or individuals for comment. A techni= 
cal staff at AEC headquarters also 
reviews the document. During this 
period, the individual writer makes 
his own corrections and changes to 
the DES. Here is one more chance for 
arguments to be expressed, hopefully 
with additional data. Comments from 
the outside begin to trickle in, and the 
team leader distributes them among 
his team members. The comments are 
studied and responses prepared. In 
my experience, the more substantial 
comments come from intervenor 
groups, the Department of the In­
terior, andthe Environmental Protec­
tion Agency. The latter's comments, 
however, very often arrive after the 
comment period. The AEC's practice 
is to wait for EPA's comments regard­
less of time, but then insist on im­
mediate responses from the team in 
order to meet a predetermined sched­
ule. It is sometimes impossible to 
respond thoroughly to those com­
ments under such conditions. 

The team's responses to the com­
ments are reviewed by the EPM, 
who makes changes or deletions as he 
sees fit. He may or may not consult 
with the particular team member be­
fore making such changes. All the 
comments and responses are then 
bound together with the modified 
draft statement, and the product pub­
lished by the AEC as the blue-covered 
Final Environmental Impact State­
ment (FES). 

The picture I have painted may not 
be representative of environmental­
impact-statement writing as practiced 
by other government agencies, but I 
hope it gives some idea that human 
beings do exist behind those anony­
mous documents. Does an EIS do 
the job it was intended to do? We are 
trying to supply scientific answers, 
translated into legal language, to what 
are social and political questions. It is 
my opinion that our society has not 
yet reached the stage where these four 
facets of the human experience can 
function smoothly together. Perhaps 
the preparation of environmental im­
pact statements, inadequate as they 
now are, is a step in that direction. • 

David Cavagnaro 



When most of us were young, the garden walls enclosed 
a world of wonder. We explored the rosebud forest, 
rivers from the garden hose, creatures of the shade. 
JJ1/ith curiosity and love, we made this tamed backyard ... 

A Child's Wilderness 

I SHARE MY WORKROOM with a 
spider. She is no spectacular beast, 

just a plain brown spider who has 
strung a rather undistinguished web 
across one corner of the window 
above my typewriter. Our working 
relationship is quite amicable. I catch 
words, she catches Aies and an occa­
sional moth. Sometimes, when the 
words evade me, I watch her going 
about her business, and there are times 
when she appears to watch me, too, 
standing at the lip of her funnel­
home, seeming to scare across the two 
feet between us. If spiders chink, I 
wonder, what does this quiet room­
mate chink of che grear, hairy creature 
she sees? Or can she even see me? Am 
I simply so huge to her char she can 
only sense my presence like a shadow 
on her world? 

These are the sort of questions a 
child might ask. They are, in face, che 
sort of questions I spent much of my 
childhood asking- of spiders, ams, 
and bees; of am-lions, pinch bugs, and 
butterflies; of garter snakes and go­
phers. Like my workroom spider, they 
were all perfeccly ordinary creatures 
living in a perfectly ordinary environ­
ment, in chis case a vacant lot next to 
my home. Yet to me they were quite 
as enthralling as if they had been oce­
lots and anacondas, and my vacant lot 
was as exotic as any jungle. Hunkered 
down, sometimes flat on my belly, I 
entered the world of inches in that 
place, becoming one with the impos­
sible journey of an ant over a sea of 
grass, with the tiny, rapid, frantic 
feeding of a caterpillar, with the 
geometry of a spider's slow architec­
ture. And there I learned some things 
chat were as iroportam, I think, as 
anything I have learned since. 

Of death. It was no gentle world, 

T. H. WATKINS 

char world of inches, but one filled 
with all che mindless savagery of ex­
istence. There were always the patient 
death watches of the spiders, of 
course, but even more fascinating to 

me were rhe am-lions sitting at the 
bottom of their half-inch pits, their 
fat little bodies hidden in sand, wait­
ing for something to stumble over the 
edge and skitter down to be pounced 
upon and dragged into a miniature 
dark. And then there were the splen• 
did wars of the ams, big, black ants 
and smaller yec incredibly durable red 
ams. Once or twice each summer I 
would witness one of these spectacles, 
seemingly as complex and deadly as 
any war between the countries of men, 
and possibly quire as senseless. The 
black ancs were always the invaders, 
but the red aocs were always the vic­
tors, making up in numbers and stub­
born ferocity what they lacked in size. 
At battle's end, the little field would 
be littered with bodies and pieces of 
bodies in a tangle of death, but by the 
next day it would be policed as clean 
as any parade ground. Ready for the 
next time. 

Of life. At tbe far end of my vacant 
lot there was a bank of morning-glory 
vines. I loved to sit beneath chem in 
che very early morning, watching the 
pastel blossoms opening as the sun 
touched them, watching the thin vines 
twitching in the new light. They grew 
as I watched them, chose vines, grew 
a millimeter at a rime, cell being added 
to cell in a process I was sure I could 
see and knew that I could feel. They 
were alive- alive as I was alive, and as 
I watched them I could imagine my 
own small body growing in the same 
rhythm, stretching to meet the warmcb 
of the morning. 

Of time. One day, while studying 

the morning-glories, I felt something 
on my hand. It was a walking-stick, 
pale green to match the early sum• 
mer grass, and it sat still on my palm 
for a long moment. All the ages 
seemed co be alive in this twiglike 
creature, and as I looked at it, not 
moving, not even breathing, I won­
dered hugely about time, about all the 
things I had learned vaguely from 
books, about fossils and dinosaur 
eggs and fish that walked, about crea­
tures surely no more outlandish than 
chis one, which seemed more plant 
than insect, w hose astonishing form 
seemed to cross the border between 
what we know and what we can only 
guess. And then it was gone, disap• 
pearing into the grass of that secret 
green place as if it had vanished into 
time itself. I never saw one again. 

Death, life, time. That small patch 
of ground gave me a sense of these at 
an age when they were large things to 
know, or at least suspect. I am a 
grown man, now, sitting in my work­
room with a small brown spider. I 
have seen eagles and whales, ante­
lopes and bears, and outside my win­
dows ac this moment I can watch p eli­
cans and egrets and great blue 
herons. I have stood in a redwood 
forest, watched sunsets from a moun­
tain, seen and touched the skull of a 
man who lived ten thousand years be­
fore me. My world has grown from 
one of inches to one of miles, and I 
have learned much. But I know that 
in only one place and at only one rime 
was I privileged co feel the flowers 
grow and hold Forever in my hand. 

T. H. JVatkins is a frequent 
co11trib11tor to the Bulletin 
and author of the new Sierra Club 
book, The Lands No One Knows. 
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Elea11or Stirling lives in 
Colorado, where she works 

as a co11s11/tantfor the 
Governor's Office on 

Human Reso11rces and the 
District 10 Regional 

Planning Commission. 
She is a J or mer news­

paper editor, freelance 
writer, and history b11JJ. 

"Rocky Mountain 
Waterfall" 

Albert Bierstadt (1830-
1902), born in Germany but 

reared in the United States, 
chose to return to Europe /or 

his art education. He.first 
traveled into the IP estern 

wilderness in 1859, With his 
career as a painter already 
la1111ched, he received per­

mission to join a government 
expedition as a civilian 

artist, achieving immediate 
Jame with his massive 

canvases, which initiated the 
Rocky Mountain School. 

For many persons, especially 
those with European tastes, 

his work was an intense intro­
duction to the splendors and 

scenic possibilities of the 
American wilderness. He 

generally managed to ,nake 
the Rockies i<Jok like the Alps, 

and his rivers each a 
trib11tary of the Rhine, but 

his paintings were a kind of 
artistic propaganda that 

enco11raged many Americans 
to seriously consider the 

esthetic worth of wilderness 
011 a grand scale. Courtesy the Anschutz Collection, Dmver 



WILDERNESS AND 
AMERICAN ART 

L
T SCHOLARS AND POLITICIANS WRANGLE: 

wilderness will continue to defy precise definition 
because it is both a fact of geography and a state of 
mind. The word comes from an Anglo-Saxon root 

meaning "the place where wild beasts live," but the con­
cept must go back to the earliest human settlements. Wil­
derness began at the edge of the clearing and extended to 
the limits of the human imagination. It was not only in­
habited by wild beasts, but animated by the fears of people 
whose grip on life was w1certain. 

For most of history, wilderness was perceived as evil­
the "howling wasteland" of the Old Testament, for ex­
ample-because it was, in fact, a place of danger and death. 
That saints and mystics regarded it also as a place of purifi­
cation was incidental to the repugnance it inspired in man­
kind as a whole. The idea that it was valuable, indeed 
essential to the human spirit, became possible only when it 
ceased to seem threatening. It is no accident that the intel­
lectual roots of wilderness preservation lie in domesticated 
I 8th century Europe, where wilderness had been unknown 
for centuries, or that their refinement and application first 
occurred in 19th century America, where, for the first 
time, wilderness was viewed as an opportunity. The first 
colonists in America brought with them the Christian's 
traditional distaste for the wilderness of the devil, and 
fancied that God had set them in its midst as a test of faith. 
Wilderness, like sin itself, was something to be overcome. 
A century later, their descendants would still see the wilder­
ness as something to be conquered, but as a test of mettle 
rather than faith. The ordeal of the parents had become the 
opportunity of me children. 

But to those early-19th century Americans looking be­
yond the fringes of their civilization, entry into the wilder­
ness across the Mississippi and Missouri rivers was viewed 
with ambivalence. On the one hand, the rich lands invited 
exploration and settlement; on the other, they were clearly 
dangerous places where death assumed many guises. Yet 
Americans needed to believe they could break with the 
traditions and influences of the Old World; ultimately, 
wilderness would be their means. Indeed, even before the 
19th century had closed, historian Frederick Jackson Tur­
ner, in the famous thesis that revolutionized the study of 
American history, could look back and conclude that the 
greatest single factor influencing the distinctive develop­
ment of society in the United States was the American 
wilderness frontier, which released the fromiersman from 
European controls. Turner declared:" ... the very fact of 
the wilderness appealed to men as a -fair, blank page on 
which to write a new chapter in the story of man's struggle 
for a higher type of society." 

But it is still a large step from the exploitive dreams of 
the American pioneer to the humanistic vision of John 
Muir. The bridge between them was built by men in the 
East-like Thoreau and Whitman- who laid the intellec­
tual fow1dations for cherishing the American earth, and by 
men in the West- explorers, trappers, and surveyors-who 
brought back from their journey reports of a land worthy 
of such sentiments. Among these messengers from beyond 
the wide Missouri were a group of artist-adventurers, land­
scape painters in the grand Romantic tradition, who sought 
the sublime in the wilderness of the West, and primitive 
nobility, in its inhabitants. 

Beginning in the late 18th century, a native school of 
American painters arose in the East. They sought self­
education in the presence of poets and philosophers, and 
their theme-a uniquely American theme-in the land 
itsel( Thomas Cole, celebrant of the American wilderness 
landscape of the East, broke with earlier art traditions and 
either omitted any sign of man and his influence from his 
canvases, or reduced human figures to minimal proportions 
in a landscape dominated by nature's works. Out of Cole's 
work grew the Hudson River School of American painters 
and from this, the Rocky Mountain School, a second gen­
eration of wilderness painters. 

By 1806, Lewis and Clark had crossed the R ockies and 
reached the Pacific, exploring and charting much of the 
immense western lands. They were followed by a host of 
trappers, sportsmen, prospectors, scientists, world trav­
elers, journalists, and perhaps most significant, military 
surveyors. From the begim1ing, many of these expeditions 
brought with them artists of greater and lesser fame and 
talent, whose work contributed philosophically and artis­
tically to the growing national concept of wilderness. 
Depicting dramatic episodes in their field sketches, draw­
ings, notebooks, journals, and paintings, they illustrated a 
variety of viewpoints and greatly affected the thinking of 
the most prominent and wealthy men and women of the 
era. But this would have been insufficient to move the will 
of the nation had not they reworked their basic wilderness 
themes in woodblo'cks, engravings, lithographs, and aqua­
tints suitable for publication in books, magazines, news­
papers, and "copies suitable for framing." In this way, they 
also reached the ordinary person of modest means and 
limited experience, and were thus instrumental in shaping 
the public attitudes that would allow the establishment of 
Yellowstone National Park even before the West was com­
pletely won. If their canvases strike us today as too ideal­
ized, too overtly sentimental, neither are we immune to 
their vision of a paradise somewhere in the West, where the 
wilderness of earth and spirit w1ite in perfect harmony. 
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Courtesy the Denver Ari /1111se11111 

"Mandan Indians" 

George Catlin (1796-1872) was a self-taught "primitive" who repudiated all sophisticated 
influences in his work. He dedicated himself to recording all he could about the Indians of the 
West, and his paintings of the Mandans, who were wiped 0111 by small pox, constitute a uniquely 
valuable chronicle of this extinct people. He was a passionate spokesman/or the Indian tribes 
of the Great Plains, whom he visited, lived with, and described so vividly in his paintings, books, 
and lecture tours in the United States and abroad. 

"Yosemite Valley" 

Thomas Hill (1829-
1908) emigrated from 

England to the United 
States in 1840, His early 
success was as a portrait 

and historical painter, 
but when he moved to San 

Francisco and joined the 
fast-growing art colony 

there, he began painting 
the magnificent wilderness 

landscapes for which he 
becamefamous. Known 

principally for his many 
views of the Yosemite 

Valley, he also painted at 
the Grand Canyon, 

Yellowstone, Donner Lake, 
and the Sierra. His prize­
winning canvases, widely 
exhibited during his life-
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time, were temporarily 
out off ashion, but have 
recently regained their 

former popularity. 

"View of the Stone Walls 
of the Upper Missouri" 

Karl Bodmer (1809-
1893) was a Swiss 

draftsman and water­
colorist who accom­

panied Prince Max­
imilian of Wied Neu­
wied on a tour of the 

United States that 
began in 1832. Sketches 

he produced during 
their trip up the 

Missouri River supple­
mented the publication 

of Maximilian's journal 
in London, and are 
considered today to 
represent the finest 

extant pictorial record 
of the Missouri frontier. 

"View of the Stone 
Walls-" is atypical; 
Bod mer pref erred to 
depict, with his.fine 

artistic training, active 
scenes of frontier life at 

the river crossings, 
forts, and settlements. 
He was exceptionally 

prolific, and his work, 
published as engravings, 

was highly regarded. 
But in the spring of 
1834 he returned to 
&rope forever, his 
American odyssey 

ended. 

Courtesy the An.schutz VJ/lectio11, Denver 



"Kidnapped" 

john Mix Stanley (1814-
1872), one of the most widely 

traveled of the wilderness 
artists, was born in New 

York and began his career 
as a humble sign painter and 

itinerant artist whose 
specialty was Indian life. 

To modern eyes his paintings 
may seem both comic and 

embarrassing, depending, as 
so many of them do, on the 

theme of the "menaced white 
woman and child," but his 

fodian Gallery was enor­
mously popular in Eastern 
cities, and more than 150 

of his paintings hung in the 
Smithsonian where, ironically, 

while the government was 
deliberating their purchase, 

all but five were 
destroyed by fire. 

umrttsy the Denver Public Library 
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"Clouds in the Canyon" 
ThomllS Moran (1837-1926), English-born, IJ11I bro11ght to the United SIIZtes IIS a child, was 
IIZrgely selj-llZllght IIS an artist and worlted for a wood engra11er to s11pport himself while he 
experimented with pencil, charcoal, inlt, and Wl6lercokw before l11rning to oils . .Iffier poorly illNs­
trating a maguine on Yellowstone in 1871, he seized the opport,"'ity lo tra11el west with the Hayden 
Geological S11r11eys, and his 111ccessj11I series of sltetches, Ull6tercolors, and paintings were among 
those that infl11enced Cnngress to set IISide the Yellowstone as the ,uition'sfirsl natio,uil parlt. 

"Herd of Buft'alo" 

William Jacob Hays 
(183C>-I875), born in New 

Y orlt, was an animal painter 
whose worlt is littk ltnown 

today, b11t in his prime, from 
1855 lo 1875, he earned 

considerable recognition IIS 

an artist and ,uit11ralist. 
He occasionally p11blished 

papers in prof mional 
scientific jo11r,uils and was 

deeply infl11enced by 
.ll11d11bon. He Ull6S also 

ltnown for getting into f wo­
cio11s battles with art critics 

011w the shape and 
d imensions of s11ch things 

as a bison h11mp. 

Courttsy tht Denver Art J\lustum 



Charles Lanman was an editor, librarian, essayist, and landscape painter. During the 1830's, he 
traveled extensively through the remaining wilderness of the eastern United States, recording 
his impressions in a series of high-flown essays and romantic paintings. Lanman's attitude toward 
wilderness was ambivalent, being a blend of the old and the new. He could, in almost the 
same breath, praise it for its primitive beauty and curse it as a place of evil and danger. 

"View of Mt. Hood" 
W. W. Armstrong (1822-

1914) was born in Ireland, 
trained abroad as a civil 

engineer, and emigrated to 
Canada in 1851, Commis­

sioned to do a series of 
paintings by the Toronto City 

Council, which were later 
published as popular litho­
graphs, Armstrong became 
familiar to both Canadians 
and Americans. He began 

seriously painting wilderness 
landscapes when he was 

appointed to the military staff 
that put down the Red River 

Rebellion in 1870-1871, He 
was ltnown as a painter of 

both Indians and wilderness 
and was extremely popular 

in Britain and eastern 
Canada as a delineator of 

the American scene. 

u11rt,sy H11rms,n's ullection of Wes tern Ari 

uurltsy th, Anschun ull,cti,m, Dtnvtr 
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NEWS (colltinued from page 28) 

port that "testing of systems targeted toward 
the ... 0.4 NOx level has virtually ceased .... 
The report team's analysis of the develop­
ment programs actually targeted toward 
0.4 gm NOx leads us to conclude that manu­
facturers must believe they will not have to 
meet 0.4 NOx in 1978, if ever."They pointed 
out that American Motors had yet to run 
the first test on its proposed 1978 NOx con­
trol system; that Chrysler had run a few 
tests, with many key components of its pro­
posed system missing. Ford Motor Com­
pany has been insisting that a 500 percent 
relaxation in the NOx standard to 2.0 grams/ 
mile would be necessary for the compa ny to 
market its proposed stratified-charge 
(CVCC) engine modeled after the design 
currently available from Honda. The EPA 
scientists, however, pointed out that, al­
though Honda has repeatedly reported test 
results under 0.4 grams, Ford had made no 
attempt to recalibrate its engines to get the 

PROVEN 
MOUNTAIN 

EQUIPMENT 
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rugged British Land Rovers - U.S., 
Mexico, and Centra l America, Send 
stamped, self-addressed envelope for 
brochure to: AMl"REK, 9 5 l CAM I N 0 
DR., SANTA CLARA, CA 95050. 
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same results. In fact, the scientists con­
tended, Ford was deliberately delaying fur­
ther progress on the CVCC engine for fear 
that success in developing the technology 
would weaken the case for relaxation of the 
standards. 

Genera l Motors, the largest of the com­
panies, has the biggest program. But whereas 
the company conducted durability tests in 
1972 on 13 dual-catalyst cars designed to 
meet the 1978 standard, its level of effort in 
1973 fell to only one such vehicle. 

ln a letter to Train, Sierra Club Executive 
Director Michael McCloskey described the 
report as "an astonishing indictment" of the 
industry's efforts. He urged Train to warn 
the industry now that he will not be able to 
grant further extensions of the NOx dead­
line, even if authorized by the Congress, if 
the industry continues its present level of 
effort, and to support provisions of the pend­
ing Brown-Ottinger Clean Air Act of 1975 
establishing excess-emission penalties for 
auto makers who fail to meet the 1978 dead­
lines, even if an extension has to be granted 
because they fail to come up with the tech­
nology. 

A sweet if unintentional 
victory in the battle to 
curb log exports 

When Congress recently passed the Tax Re­
duction Act, it unintentionally doubled the 
taxes on the exportation of domestic timber. 
The act repealed tax benefits for all products 
entitled to them under Section 611 of the 
Internal Revenue Code. Before this, log ex­
porters were permitted to postpone indefi­
nitely income taxes on 50 percent of their 
gross revenues. Environmentalists, inde­
pendent forest industries, and some labor 
unions had been trying for some time to re­
duce log exports significantly. 

Wilderness park proposed 
for Ontario's Missinaibi 

The Sierra Club of Ontario (Canada) re­
cently proposed a 260-mile wiJd river park 
on the Missinaibi R iver between Lake Su­
perior and James Bay. Club Chairman Rich­
ard Symns said he was encouraged by early 
government response from the Natural Re­
sources Ministry, which apparently already 
had its eye on the Missinaibi. "We've been 
interested and done some work there," said 
Parks Branch Director J. W. Keenan. "The 
Sierra Club obviously has done a lot of work 
and made a comprehensive proposal. They 
are not being wild-eyed about it.'' 

The club's proposal quotes the govern­
ment's own outdoor recreation survey to 
emphasize potential use of such a park. lt 
points to the historical significance of the 
river as one of the main arteries of the fur 
trade, and to the fact that the Missinaibi af-

fords virtually the last chance to establish an 
unspoiled wild river park within easy reach 
of southern Ontario's urban centers. One 
club member. an ardent river enthusiast, 
said: " Almost every other river I have been 
on was despoiled. You keep wondering 
whether your children will have the chance 
to use an unspoiled river." 

Loggers already have their eyes on the 
Missinaibi, and Ontario Hydro has plans for 
a dam that would drown one of the most 
spectacular parts of the river and cause ir­
reparable damage to downstream ecosys­
tems while providing only .003 percent of 
Ontario's 1973 electricity supply! The pro­
posed 260-mile park would increase by more 
than 50 percent some 500 stream-miles of 
wild river parks in five areas already desig­
nated by Ontario. An informational bro­
chure entitled "The Missinaibi: A Wild 
River Park Proposal," by the Sierra Club of 
Ontario, as well as additional information, 
are available from: The Missinaibi River 
Project, Sierra Club of Ontario, 47 Colborne 
Street, Suite 308, Toronto, M5E I E3 
CANADA. 

Sierra Club supports 
corporate disclosure 

The quandary of how to get better informa­
tion about corporate activities that may have 
a detrimental effect on the environment, and 
with it some idea of how to control these ac­
Livities, has been of long-standing interest to 
the club. Recently, as the result of a lawsuit 
brought by the National Resources Defense 
Council, a small crack was opened in the 
door of corporate secrecy by the Securities 
and Exchange Commission (SEC). which 
scheduled hearings on possible modification 
of corporate-disclosure rules. 

In a statement presented to an SEC hear­
ing in Washington, D .C., club Executive 
Director Michael McCloskeysupported new 
requirements for greater disclosure of envi­
ronmentally relevant activities of U.S. cor­
porations. 'There is a great information gap 
between the self-serving claims of some com­
panies, who contend they are doing a model 
job, and the outright defiance of other com­
panies, who constantly rail against the idea 
of complying with environmental laws. In­
vestors-and consumers too-need some 
way of obtaining concise information about 
the environmental record or major compa­
nies." 

Mccloskey suggested greater annual dis­
closure of informatioll about ( I) investment 
in pollution-control technology, (2) tonnage 
of uncolltrolled effiuents and emissions, 
(3) money spent on environmental research, 
(4) energy consumption, (5) percentage of 
natural resources inventory used or sold. 
(6) investment in rehabilitating development 
sites. and (7) toxic ~ubstances produced. The 
SEC is now Sllldying the hearing record, and 
perhaps, new regulations will be forthcom­
ing. • 
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ther accessory strap medallions on 
bottom. Start to finish sewing lime; 
approx. 3 hours for the novice sewer. 
Colors: Royal Blue, Forest Green and 
Orange. $9.50 (add 75<J: handling). 

"BIKEBAG" 
KIT 

"BIKEBAG" KIT 
Ideal for any full sized bike. Water­
proof, CORDURA nylon with two zip 
open pockets. 7-1 / 2" x 9" size. Very 
easy to complete in a couple of hours. 
Colors: Royal B lue. Forest Green and 
Orange. S8.50 (add 75¢ handling). 

ORDER TODAY! 
Master Charge. BankAmericard & Ameri­

can Express honored. Immediate delivery! 

FREE! 
MAIL ORDER CATALOG 

~ 
Dept. 6-175H • Box 7 Boulder. Colo. 80302 

r;:~ 
t IN ENERGY i 
i Have you read these articles that appeared in back issues of the § 

§ S~er;:c~::::~~~~:?Environmental Dilemma. Nancy Dooley. §t 

I 
February 1972. 

• Energy: Tomorrow Starts Today. James Spaulding. December 1972. 

1
. 

• The Crisis We Won't Face Squarely. Robert Entwistle. November/ 
December 1973. 

• Energy, Environment, and the Qua/iJy of Life. Laurence I. Moss. 
§§. February 1974. l 

• 700,000,000,000 Barrels of Soot. David Sumner and Carolyn 
§ Johnson. April 1974. 
§ • Solar Energy Now. James Spaulding. May 1974. § 
§ • In Time to Stop. Senator John Tunney. September 1974. § 

t With a few exceptions, back issues of the Sierra Club Bulletin (1903-1975) t 

I
. are available. Annuals: $2.50. All other issues: $.50. f 

To order back issues, send a check or money order payable to Sierra Club 'J 

Bulletin to: Sierra Club Bulletin , 1050 Mills Tower, San Francisco, CA § 
94104. § 

§ 
.q,~~.q,.q,~.q,~~,q,,.q,.q,.q, 

TRAILWISE 
• 1n manufacturing specialists 

quality wilderness eq · ment 

- ~ 

'-,._ __ IIW'lnl'~Ti-~ ettPa:.-mountalneermg/ B'ackpacking shops 
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Please enter a membership for me at the 
race checked below: 

fee• Dues Total 

• Life .... .. . . . . . .. . . • $400.00 $400.00 
D Contributing . ... .. . $5.00 50.00 55.00 
• Supporting ..... , . . . 5.00 25.00 30.00 
• Regular ............ 5.00 15.00 20.00 

• with apouae . ..... 5.00 23.00 28.00 
• Junior (thru 14) .... • 8.00 8.00 
:J Student ...... ...... • 8.00 8.00 

• with epouae . . , ... • 18.00 18.00 
0 Senior (60 & over) .. 5.00 8.00 13.00 

• with epouee .. .. .. 5.00 13.00 18.00 

•AdmiMion fee is waived for junior members, full­
time etudente, and Life Members. 

Nam,__ ______________ _ 

Address--------------
____________ zip ___ _ 

Mail to: 

P.O. Box 7959 Rincon Annex 
San Francisco, Calif. 94120 

Sierra Club 

ierra Club Membership. 
l 'IU.l J UST THE M OUNTAINS ... 

. . . but your chance to explore 
the whole splendid world arotmd you-yottr chance to help 

in our efforts to keep it splendid-and alive. 

OUTINGS: From peaks in Alaska and Asia to nearby mttseums, the Sierra 
Club and its forty-eight local chapters sponsor trips literally by the thousands. 

WILDERNESS SKILLS: Instruction in rock climbing . . . winter camping 
... river touring .. . nature photography. These and others are offered by many 
chapters of the Sierra Club. 

INNER-CITY OUTINGS: City children sometimes ask what the "environ­
ment" has to do with them. These special Sierra Club outings take just those 
inner-city children to places they will never forget. 

CLEANUP TRIPS: Trash in the wilderness, litter in the neighborhood 
park ... Sierra Club groups help clean it up and haul it out-and have fun 
at it, as well. 

AND THE ISSUES: 

STRIPMINING. President Ford has just vetoed a compromise bill which would 
make stripminers restore the land they have disrupted. Congress will cry co over­
ride. Whatever happens, the fight will continue. 

YOSEMITE. The resolution of the "MCA Affair" will have important implica­
tions for every national park. Our efforrs here have opened a new door for public 
participation in planning for our parks. 

WH ALES. The debate continues. So does the slaughter of some of the most mar­
velous-and most incelligent-creacures chat have ever lived on earth. 

WILDERNESS. Right now, just over one-half of one percent of America's land is 
in protected wilderness areas. A pretty small beginning. But the National Wilder­
ness Preservation System could grow considerably chis year-with your support. 

BUREAU OF LAND MANAGEMENT. This licrle-kaown federal agency con­
trols about 170 million acres of spectacular land in the American West, and much 
more in Alaska. The Bureau wants Congress co pass an Organic Acr co give it the 
management power it needs. We agree-but we think the Act should also reverse 
some outmoded BLM policies. 

ENERGY. Industry says we muse sacrifice anything, everything, co hasten "energy 
independence." The Sierra Club disagrees. We propose a balanced energy plan­
cue down on energy wastes, and find new energy sources which our environment 
can afford. 

LAND-USE PLANNING. Behind the many crises of the moment, there is a 
basic question ... "How can we use our land without destroying it, so it will con­
tinue serving our needs in the future?" A bill now in Congress would be a first seep. 

If you aren't a member of the Sierra Club, we invite you to join us. If you're 
already a member, perhaps you would like to give a membership to a friend. 
Either way, an application blank is provided at left for your convenience. 

Sierra Club 




